AGENDA
REGULAR CITY COUNCIL MEETING, JOINT MEETING OF THE CITY COUNCIL
AND THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE COTATI COMMUNITY
REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY
WEDNESDAY MARCH 23, 2011
7:00 PM REGULAR SESSION
City Council Chambers, City Hall, 201 W. Sierra Avenue

The Cotati City Council welcomes you to its meetings that are generally scheduled for the 2" and 4" Wednesday of every
month. Your interest and participation are encouraged and appreciated.

City Council meeting agendas, minutes and audio recordings (podcast) are posted on the City’'s website at
www.ci.cotati.ca.us. To receive the City Council Agenda by e-mail, sign up for City of Cotati community notifications at
www.nixle.com. Contact the Deputy City Clerk at ttaylor@ci.cotati.ca.us or 707-665-3622 for questions about the agenda.

Notice is hereby given that Council may discuss and/or take action on any or all of the items listed on this agenda.

Any writings or documents provided to a majority of the Cotati City Council regarding any item on this agenda will be made
available for public inspection in the City Manager's office located at 201 West Sierra Avenue, Cotati, California, during
normal business hours.

Disabled Accommodation: Upon request, this agenda will be made available in appropriate formats to persons with
disabilities as required by Section 202 of the Americans with Disabilities Act of 1990. Any person with a disability who
requires a modification or accommodation in order to participate in a meeting should contact the Deputy City Clerk at (707)
665-3622 at least 48 hours in advance of the meeting.

Waiver Warning: If you challenge decisions/direction of the City Council of the City of Cotati in court, you may be limited to
raising only those issues you or someone else raised at public hearing(s) described in this Agenda, or in written
correspondence delivered to the City of Cotati at, or prior to, the public hearing(s).

Those wishing to address the Council are asked to complete a speaker card and give it to the Deputy City Clerk.
Please limit comments to three minutes or as the Mayor directs.; When you are called, step to the podium and state
your name and address for the record. Persons wishing to address the Council are not required to identify themselves
(Gov't. Code § 54953.3); however, this information assists the Mayor by ensuring that all persons wishing to address the
Council are recognized and it assists the Deputy City Clerk in preparing the City Council meeting minutes.

6:00 PM CLOSED SESSION CALL TO ORDER (CITY COUNCIL CHAMBERS)
PUBLIC COMMENT ON CLOSED SESSION
ADJOURNMENT TO CLOSED SESSION (CITY MANAGER’S OFFICE)

CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNSEL
Initiation of Litigation (Government Code Section 54956.9(c)) (One Potential Matter)

7:00 PM REGULAR SESSION
CALL TO ORDER OF REGULAR CITY COUNCIL MEETING

REPORT OUT OF CLOSED SESSION




City Council Agenda
March 23, 2011
Page 2 of 4

ROLL CALL
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

1. APPROVAL OF MINUTES OF THE MARCH 9, 2011 REGULAR MEETING AND
MARCH 15 SPECIAL MEETING AND NOTICE OF WAIVING OF READING OF ALL
RESOLUTIONS AND ORDINANCES INTRODUCED AND/OR ADOPTED UNDER THIS
AGENDA (Action)

ANNOUNCEMENTS

Blood Bank of the Redwoods is conducting a mobile blood drive on Saturday March 26 from 10:00
a.m. to 1:30 p.m. at Oliver's Market, located at 546 E.Cotati Avenue.

The Cotati Historical Society Museum is open regularly on Saturdays from 1:00 — 4:00 p.m. and the
2" Wednesday of each month from 5:30-8:30 p.m.

The second Open House workshop for the Old Redwood Highway Downtown Street Improvement
project will be on Tuesday March 29, at 7:00 p.m. in the City Council chamber.

A General Plan Vision Workshop will be held on Wednesday, April 6, 2011 from 2 to 4 pm in the
City Council Chamber. Details can be found on the web at cotati.generalplan.org.

PROCLAMATION

DECLARING APRIL 2011 AS CHILD ABUSE PREVENTION MONTH

CITY MANAGER’S REPORT
APPROVAL OF FINAL AGENDA

CITIZEN BUSINESS

Any member of the public wishing to speak to the Council on any item or items listed on the Consent Calendar or any item or
items not listed on the agenda that are within the subject matter jurisdiction of the Council may do so at this time. Pursuant to
the Brown Act, the Council is not allowed to consider issues or take action on any item not listed on the agenda during this
period. Comments of any member of the public are normally restricted to a total of three (3) minutes in length per person for
matters not on the agenda and a total of three (3) minutes per person in length for items on the Consent Calendar.

DIRECTION ON FUTURE AGENDA ITEMS
CONSENT CALENDAR

2. SECOND READING AND ADOPTION OF TWO ORDINANCES ADOPTING
AMENDMENTS TO THE STATE BUILDING AND FIRE CODES AND AMENDING
MUNICIPAL CODE SECTION 14.04 BUILDING CODES, AND ADDING SECTION 14.06
REPAIR OF DAMAGED STRUCTURES (Community Development) (Action)

It is recommended that the City Council adopt 2 ordinances: 1) Adopting amendments in accordance
with State law to the California Building Code; California Residential Code; California Fire Code;
California Plumbing Code; International Existing Building Code 2009 Edition; and the Green
Building Code Standards (CAL Green); 2) Repair and Reconstruction Ordinance.



City Council Agenda
March 23, 2011
Page 3 of 4

3. RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE PARK IMPROVEMENTS FOR SANTERO WAY
PARK AND ACCEPTING THE OFFER OF DEDICATION (Community Development)
(Action)

It is recommended that the City Council adopt a resolution accepting the park improvements for
Santero Way and accepting the Offer of Dedication.

REGULAR AGENDA

4. SIDEWALK AND VEGETATION MAINTENANCE PROGRAM (Engineering/Public
Works) (Report)

It is recommended that the City Council receive and file the report on the sidewalk and vegetation
maintenance program.

5. REQUEST TO RENEW AN ANNUAL LICENSE FOR A MEDICAL MARIJUANA
DISPENSARY LICENSE AT 7950 REDWOOD DRIVE, SUITE 8 (APN: 144-060-006)

It is recommended that the City Council adopt a resolution approving a request to renew an annual
license for Mercy Wellness, an existing Medical Marijuana Dispensary located at 7950 Redwood
Drive, Suite 8.

6. APPOINTMENTS TO MAYORS’ AND COUNCILMEMBERS” ASSOCIATION AND CITY
SELECTION COMMITTEES

It is recommended that the City Council adopt a motion to support its choices from those Sonoma
County Council members who have submitted letters of interest for appointment by the Mayors’ and
Councilmembers’ Association to the Association of Bay Area Government (ABAG) Executive
Board and the Sonoma County Agricultural Preservation and Open Space District; and by the City
Selection Committee to the Airport Land Use Commission, Local Agency Formation Commission
(LAFCO) (Alternate Member); and California Coastal Commission.

ADJOURNMENT OF REGULAR MEETING OF THE CITY COUNCIL AND CALL TO ORDER
OF JOINT MEETING OF CITY COUNCIL AND COTATI COMMUNITY REDEVELOPMENT
AGENCY BOARD OF DIRECTORS

CONSENT CALENDAR (JOINT MEETING)

The following items listed on the Consent Calendar are considered routine in nature and require little or no further discussion by
the Council, public or applicant and action may be taken by the City Council by a single motion. Unless already having done so
under Citizen Business, any member of the public may comment at this time on items on this Consent Calendar prior to the
Council's consideration of the Consent Calendar. Comments of on the Consent Calendar are normally restricted to a total of
three (3) minutes in length per person. Any member of the Council may request that any listed item be removed from the
Consent Calendar. That item shall be placed on the Regular Agenda section of the Council meeting and considered by the
Council as other matters on the Regular Agenda portion of the Agenda.



City Council Agenda
March 23, 2011
Page 4 of 4

7.  WARRANTS AND AUDITED CLAIMS FEBRUARY 25th, 2011 — March 9th 2011
(Administrative Services) (Action)

This motion receives and files warrants and audited claims for February 25th, 2011 — March 9th,
2011.

ADJOURNMENT OF JOINT MEETING; RECONVENING OF REGULAR MEETING OF CITY
COUNCIL

CITY COUNCIL REPORTS (Discussion)

ADJOURNMENT

Certification of Posting of the Agenda: | declare under penalty of perjury that | am employed by the City of Cotati and that | posted
this agenda on the bulletin boards of City Hall, Veterans’ Memorial Building and the U.S. Post Office on or before March 18, 2011.

/sl Tamara Taylor, Deputy City Clerk



DRAFT

Printed 3/17/2011 4:22 PM

MINUTES
REGULAR CITY COUNCIL MEETING, JOINT MEETING OF THE CITY COUNCIL
AND THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE COTATI COMMUNITY
REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY
WEDNESDAY MARCH 9, 2011
7:00 PM REGULAR SESSION
City Council Chambers, City Hall, 201 W. Sierra Avenue

7:00 PM REGULAR SESSION

CALL TO ORDER OF REGULAR CITY COUNCIL MEETING
Mayor Orchard called the meeting to order at 7:01 p.m.

ROLL CALL

Councilmembers present: Councilmembers Coleman-Senghor, Gilardi, and Landman, Vice Mayor
Harvey and Mayor Orchard.

Staff present: Director of Administrative Services Jone Hayes, Acting Community Development
Director/Assistant to the City Manager Marsha Sue Lustig, Police Chief Michael Parish, City Attorney
Rich Rudnansky, Building Official Glen Schainblatt, Deputy City Clerk Tamara Taylor and City Manager
Dianne Thompson.

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
Mayor Orchard led the pledge of allegiance.

1. APPROVAL OF MINUTES OF THE FEBRUARY 23, 2011 REGULAR MEETING
MEETING AND NOTICE OF WAIVING OF READING OF ALL RESOLUTIONS AND
ORDINANCES INTRODUCED AND/OR ADOPTED UNDER THIS AGENDA (Action)

Moved by Councilmember Gilardi, seconded by Councilmember Landman, and passed
unanimously to approve the minutes of the February 23, 2011 Regular meeting as presented.

ANNOUNCEMENTS

The 19th Annual Cotati Pasta Dinner & Bingo event will be held on Saturday March 12, 2010 from
5 p.m. to 8 p.m. at the Cotati Veterans Memorial Building. For details contact the Cotati Chamber of
Commerce at 707-795-5508 or on the web at cotati.org.

The General Plan update will commence with a kick off at the Planning Commission meeting on
Monday March 21 at 7:00 p.m. in the City Council Chamber. For the latest information on the
General Plan on the web go to cotati.generalplan.org.

The Cotati Historical Society Museum is open regularly on Saturdays from 1:00 — 4:00 p.m. and the
2" Wednesday of each month from 5:30-8:30 p.m.



City Council Minutes
March 9, 2011
Page 2 of 5

The second Open House workshop for the Old Redwood Highway Downtown Street Improvement
project will be on Tuesday March 29, at 7:00 p.m. in the City Council chamber.

CITY MANAGER’S REPORT

Cit%/ Manager Dianne Thompson reported the economic development leadership forum will be on April
30" at a time to be announced; and that a new calendar has been posted on the City website.

APPROVAL OF FINAL AGENDA
City Manager Thompson announced that Item 5 has been pulled from the agenda.
CITIZEN BUSINESS

Rancho Adobe Fire District Chief Frank Traenor discussed his previous request for District funding and
submitted regarding other Redevelopment Agencies definition of blight. He commented on funding

George Barich commented on the budget review schedule, the Capital Improvement Program and taking
photographs during the Council meeting.

Greg Karraker addressed the Council regarding his concerns about the impact of the Old Redwood
Highway improvement project on the business parking.

Councilmembers briefly discussed comments made during Citizen Business.
DIRECTION ON FUTURE AGENDA ITEMS
PUBLIC HEARING (JOINT MEETING)

2. INTRODUCTION OF THREE ORDINANCES ADOPTING AMENDMENTS TO THE
STATE BUILDING AND FIRE CODES, AMENDING MUNICIPAL CODE SECTION 14.04.
BUILDING CODES, ADDING SECTION 14.06 REPAIR OF DAMAGED STRUCTURES,
LOCAL ENERGY EFFICIENCY STANDARDS 14.05; THE REPEAL OF RESOLUTION
04-84 ADOPTING A SUSTAINABLE BUILDING PROGRAM AND 06-24, AMENDING
THE SUSTAINABLE BUILDING PROGRAM; APPROVAL OF RESOLUTION
ADOPTING A REVISED FEE SCHEDULE (Community Development) (Action)

City Manager Dianne Thompson introduced Building Official Glen Schainblatt and described his
background.

Glen Schainblatt, Interim Building Official, presented the staff report and responded to questions
from the Council regarding the proposed Code amendments.

Rancho Adobe Fire District Chief Traenor spoke in support of the proposed Code amendments and
responded to questions from the Council regarding the proposed California Fire Code amendments.

Mayor Orchard opened the floor to public comment.

The following individuals spoke:



City Council Minutes
March 9, 2011
Page 3 of 5

Ben Boyce with the Accountable Development Coalition (supported)

Randy Collins, President of Sonoma County Fire Chiefs Association (supported)

Greg Karraker (opposed)

There being no one else wishing to speak, Mayor Orchard closed the public comment period.

The Council commended staff members for their work on the proposal and expressed its support.

Ms. Lustig recommended that the motion to approve the resolution as revised by the submitted
errata and by the inclusion in the resolution and the ordinances of a notion that it becomes effective
30 days after adoption.

Moved by Councilmember Landman seconded by Vice Mayor Susan Harvey and passed
unanimously to introduce 3 ordinances; and to repeal Resolutions 04-84 and 06-24 (Sustainable
Building Program); and to adopt a resolution revised as noted by Ms. Lustig above and entitled
respectively:

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF COTATI AMENDING CHAPTER
14.04 OF THE COTATI MUNICIPAL CODE IN ITS ENTIRETY AND, ADOPTING BY
REFERENCE THE FOLLOWING CODES:2010 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING
STANDARDS CODE,CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS TITLE 24, PART 1 - 2010
CALIFORNIAADMINISTRATIVE CODE; PART 2 - 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE
BASEDON THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE; 2010 CALIFORNIA
RESIDENTIAL CODE BASED ON THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE; 2010
CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE BASED ON THE 2008 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE;
PART 4 - 2010 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE BASED ON THE 2009 UNIFORM
MECHANICAL CODE; PART 5 - 2010 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE BASED ON THE
2009 UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE; PART 6 - 2010 CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE; PART 9 -
2010 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, BASED ON THE 2009 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL
FIRE CODE; PART 10 - 2010 CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE BASED ON THE
2009 INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE; PART 11 CALIFORNIA GREEN
BUILDING STANDARDS CODE; PART 12 - 2010 CALIFORNIA REFERENCED
STANDARDS CODE, APPENDIX CHAPTER J (GRADING) AMENDED BY DELETING
J103.2 EXCEPTIONS 1 H (SIGNS) AND | (PATIO COVERS) OF THE CALIFORNIA
BUILDING CODE; APPENDIX CHAPTER A (CODE STANDARD 6-2) OF THE CALIFORNIA
MECHANICAL CODE; AND OF THE CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE AS PUBLISHED BY
THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL; and

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF COTATI, CALIFORNIA,
ADDING CHAPTER 14.05, LOCAL ENERGY EFFICIENCY STANDARDS TO THE COTATI
MUNICIPAL CODE FOR THE PURPOSE OF ADOPTING LOCAL ENERGY EFFICIENCY
STANDARDS FOR BUILDINGS COVERED BY THE 2008 CALIFORNIA BUILDING
ENERGY EFFICIENCY STANDARDS; and

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF COTATI ADDING A NEW CHAPTER 14.06 TO TITLE 14
OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE RELATING TO REPAIR OF DAMAGED STRUCTURES; and



City Council Minutes
March 9, 2011
Page 4 of 5

RESOLUTION NO. 2011-07 ENTITLED: RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE
CITY OF COTATI PROVIDING FOR PERMIT FEES IN ACCORDANCE WITH AN
ORDINANCE ADOPTING THE 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODES FOR THE CITY OF
COTATL

ADJOURNMENT OF REGULAR MEETING OF THE CITY COUNCIL AND CALL TO ORDER
OF JOINT MEETING OF CITY COUNCIL AND COTATI COMMUNITY REDEVELOPMENT
AGENCY BOARD OF DIRECTORS

Mayor Orchard adjourned the Regular meeting and called to order the joint meeting at 7:57 p.m.
CONSENT CALENDAR (JOINT MEETING)
Councilmember Gilardi requested that item 6 be pulled for discussion.

Moved by Council/Board member Gilardi, seconded by Vice Mayor/Board member Susan Harvey, and
passed unanimously to approve items 3 and 4 on the consent calendar.

3. WARRANTS AND AUDITED CLAIMS FEBRUARY 11th, 2011 — February 24th, 2011
(Administrative Services) (Action)

This motion receives and files warrants and audited claims for February 11th, 2011 — February
24th, 2011.

4. OLD REDWOOD HIGHWAY STREET IMPROVEMENT PROJECT - FINAL
ENVIRONMENTAL REVIEW AND DESIGN AGREEMENT (Engineering/Public Work)
(Action)

This motion authorizes the City Manager to execute an agreement with Omni-Means for final
environmental review and design of the Old Redwood Highway Street Improvement Project.

5. ADOPTION OF A RESOLUTION APPROVING SALARY AND BENEFITS CHANGES
FOR UNREPRESENTED EMPLOYEES (Administrative Services) (Action)

This item was pulled from the agenda.

6. ADOPTION OF A RESOLUTION APPROVING AMENDMENT NO.2 TO THE CITY
MANAGER EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENT (Administrative Services) (Action)

It is recommended that the City Council / Agency approve a resolution approving amendment no. 2
to the City Manager Employment Agreement between the City of Cotati and Dianne Thompson.

Councilmember Gilardi explained that she had pulled this item at the request of a member of the
community. She noted that the City Manager is voluntarily donating back 10% of her salary to the
General Fund and that the Council agreed to incentives for Economic Development because it is
important to the community.

Mayor Orchard opened the item to public comment; there being no one wishing to speak, Mayor
Orchard closed the public comment period.



City Council Minutes
March 9, 2011
Page 5 of 5

Moved by Councilmember Gilardi, seconded by Vice Mayor Susan Harvey, and passed
unanimously to approve Resolutions No. 2011-08 and CRA 232 entitled: RESOLUTION OF THE
CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF COTATI APPROVING AMENDMENT NO. 2 TO
EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENT WITH DIANNE THOMPSON FOR CITY MANAGER
SERVICES, AND AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO EXECUTE SAME

ADJOURNMENT OF JOINT MEETING; RECONVENING OF REGULAR MEETING OF CITY
COUNCIL

Mayor Orchard adjourned the Joint meeting and reconvened the Regular meeting at 8:03 p.m.
CITY COUNCIL REPORTS (Discussion)

Councilmembers reported on recent and upcoming activities, including reports from meetings attended at
City expense.

ADJOURNMENT TO CLOSED SESSION (CITY MANAGER’S OFFICE)
Mayor Orchard adjourned the meeting at 8:09 p.m.
CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNSEL

Initiation of Litigation (Government Code Section 54956.9(c)) (One Potential Matter)

Existing Litigation ( Government Code Section 54956.9(a))
Colvin Group 1, L.P. vs. City of Cotati, et. al. (Sonoma County Superior Court Case No. SCV-248067)

Wildease, LLC, dba Countryside Mobilehome Park vs. City of Cotati, et. Al. (Sonoma County Superior
Court Case # SCV 247044)

REPORT OUT OF CLOSED SESSION

Mayor Orchard announced that there was nothing to report out of closed session.

Respectfully submitted,

Tamara Taylor, Deputy City Clerk






DRAFT

MINUTES
SPECIAL JOINT MEETING OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
COTATI AND THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE COTATI COMMUNITY
REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY
6:30 PM TUESDAY MARCH 15, 2011
City Council Chambers, City Hall, 201 W. Sierra Avenue

1. CALL TO ORDER (CITY COUNCIL CHAMBER)

Mayor Orchard called the meeting to order at 6:30 p.m. and asked for the roll call:
Councilmembers present: Councilmembers Coleman-Senghor, Gilardi, and Landman, Vice
Mayor Harvey (via teleconference from 5970 River View Road, Mackay, Idaho, 83251) and
Mayor Orchard.

Staff present: Acting Community Development Director/Assistant to the City Manager Marsha
Sue Lustig, City Engineer/Director of Public Works Damien O’Bid, City Attorney Robin
Donoghue and, Deputy City Clerk Tamara Taylor

2. PUBLIC COMMENT

a. Public Comment from local jurisdiction
None.

b. Public Comment from teleconference location
None.

3. CONSIDER ADOPTION OF CITY COUNCIL AND COMMUNITY REDEVELOPMENT

AGENCY RESOLUTIONS APPROVING TRANSFER OF CERTAIN REAL
PROPERTIES OWNED BY THE COMMUNITY REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY,
AUTHORIZING THE EXECUTION OF A DISPOSITION AND DEVELOPMENT
AGREEMENT FOR THE TRANSFERS, AND APPROVING AND AUTHORIZING
RELATED TRANSACTIONS

City Engineer/Director of Public Works Damien O’Bid presented the staff report and responded to

questions from the Council regarding the impacts to the City of proposed property transfer.
City Attorney Donoghue responded to questions regarding a potential challenge of the State
oversight committee to the proposed property transfer, and the City’s possible responses to
potential challenges.

The Council commended staff expressed support for the proposed property transfer.



City Council Minutes

March 15, 2011
Page 2 of 2 DRA FT

4. Moved by Councilmember Coleman-Senghor, seconded by Councilmember Gilardi and passed
unanimously to adopt Resolution No. 2011-09 entitled: A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY
COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF COTATI APPROVING THE TRANSFER OF CERTAIN
PROPERTIES FOR REDEVELOPMENT AND AUTHORIZING THE EXECUTION OF A
DISPOSITION AND DEVELOPMENT AGREEMENT WITH THE COTATI COMMUNITY
REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY AND APPROVING AND AUTHORIZING RELATED
ACTIONS

Moved by Councilmember Coleman-Senghor, seconded by Councilmember Gilardi and passed
unanimously to adopt Resolution No. Resolution No., CRA-233 entitled: A RESOLUTION OF
THE COTATI COMMUNITY REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY APPROVING THE TRANSFER
OF CERTAIN PROPERTIES FOR REDEVELOPMENT AND AUTHORIZING THE
EXECUTION OF A DISPOSITION AND DEVELOPMENT AGREEMENT WITH THE CITY
OF COTATI AND APPROVING AND AUTHORIZING RELATED ACTIONS

5. ADJOURNMENT

Mayor Orchard adjourned the meeting at 6:56 p.m.

Respectfully submitted,

Tamara Taylor, Deputy City Clerk



Item No. 2

City Council Agenda
Consent Calendar

Subject: Second reading and adoption of two ordinances adopting amendments to the State
Building and Fire Codes and amending Municipal Code Section 14.04 Building
Codes, and adding section 14.06 Repair of Damaged Structures

Date: March 23, 2011

Written by: Glenn Schainblatt, Interim Building Official

Recommendation

It is recommended that the City Council adopt 2 ordinances: 1) Adopting amendments in
accordance with State law to the California Building Code; California Residential Code;
California Fire Code; California Plumbing Code; International Existing Building Code 2009
Edition; and the Green Building Code Standards (CAL Green); 2) Repair and Reconstruction
Ordinance.

Background

At its Regular meeting on March 9, 2011, the conducted a public hearing and unanimously
introduced three ordinances: 1) Adoption of California Building Code; California Residential
Code; California Fire Code; California Plumbing Code; International Existing Building Code
2009 Edition; and the Green Building Code Standards (CAL Green), 2) Repair and
Reconstruction Ordinance; and 3) Locally Adopted Energy Efficiency Standards.

Analysis/Discussion

Ordinances listed as 1) and 2) above are recommended for adoption at this time. The Local
Energy Efficiency ordinance (number 3 above) has been sent to the California Energy
Commission for their required approval before coming back to City Council for the second
reading and adoption.

Financial Considerations

None.

Environmental Issues

None.

Attachments:
1. Ordinances

GS:tlt



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF COTATI AMENDING
CHAPTER 14.04 OF THE COTATI MUNICIPAL CODE IN ITS ENTIRETY AND,
ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE FOLLOWING CODES:
2010 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODE,
CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS TITLE 24, PART 1 - 2010 CALIFORNIA
ADMINISTRATIVE CODE; PART 2 - 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE BASED
ON THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE; 2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL
CODE BASED ON THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE; 2010
CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE BASED ON THE 2008 NATIONAL
ELECTRICAL CODE; PART 4 - 2010 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE BASED
ON THE 2009 UNIFORM MECHANICAL CODE; PART 5 - 2010 CALIFORNIA
PLUMBING CODE BASED ON THE 2009 UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE; PART 6 -
2010 CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE; PART 9 -2010 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE,
BASED ON THE 2009 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE; PART 10 -
2010 CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE BASED ON THE 2009
INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE; PART 11 CALIFORNIA GREEN
BUILDING STANDARDS CODE; PART 12 - 2010 CALIFORNIA REFERENCED
STANDARDS CODE, APPENDIX CHAPTER J (GRADING) AMENDED BY
DELETING J103.2 EXCEPTIONS 1 H (SIGNS) AND | (PATIO COVERS) OF THE
CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE; APPENDIX CHAPTER A (CODE STANDARD 6-2)
OF THE CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE; AND OF THE CALIFORNIA
PLUMBING CODE AS PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL;

The City Council of the City of Cotati does ordain as follows:

Section 1: Chapter 14.04, “Uniform Codes”, of the City of Cotati Municipal Code is amended in its
entirety to read as follows:

14.04.010 Adoption of codes by reference

The Uniform Codes and the International Codes together with any amendments thereof, as hereinafter
set forth in the Ordinance, are adopted and made part of this Ordinance, together with amendments
and additions to the various codes; providing penalties for the violation thereof and repealing all
ordinances in conflict therewith.

14.04.20 Copies on file

One certified copy of each of the Codes so adopted, along with any amendment thereto,
shall be kept on file for the use and examination by the public and located at the
City of Cotati building department.

14.04.025 Findings

The City Council of the City of Cotati finds that in order to best protect the health, safety and welfare
of the citizens of the City of Cotati, the standards of building within the City must conform with state
law except where local conditions warrant more restrictive regulations. Therefore, the City Council
desires to adopt the current state building and fire codes, contained in California Building Standards



Code Title 24, and other uniform codes governing the construction and regulation of buildings and
structures with the modifications and amendments contained herein.

Pursuant to California Health and Safety Code section 17958.7, the City Council makes the factual
findings hereto and incorporated herein by reference, and finds that the amendments made in this
ordinance to the California Building Standards Code Title 24, are reasonably necessary because of the
local climatic, geological or topographical conditions described in the following:

The City wishes to adopt by reference the following codes, with such amendments as may be
necessary to conform to local climatic, geologic, and topographical conditions:

California Code of Regulations Title-24

14.04.030 Part 1 — 2010 California Administrative Code;

14.04.040 Part 2 — 2010 California Building Code, Volume 1 and 2, including
Appendix Chapters, J (Grading) amended to delete J103.2 Exception #1,
Chapters H and I;

14.04.050 Part 2.5- 2010 California Residential Code;
14.04.060 Part 3 — 2010 California Electrical Code;

14.04.070 Part 4 — 2010 California Mechanical Code including Chapters A, B, C,
and D;

14.04.080 Part 5 — 2010 California Plumbing Code including Appendix
Chapters A, B, D, and I;

14.04.090 Part 6 — 2010 California Energy Code;

14.04.100  Part 8- 2010 California Historical Building Code
14.04.110 Part 9 — 2010 California Fire Code;
14.04.120 Part 10 — 2010 California Existing Building Code;

14.04.130 Part 11- 2010 California Green Building Standards Code;
14.04.140  Part 12 — 2010 California References Standard Code;
14.04.150 2009 Edition International Existing Building Code;

Under the provisions of Section 17958.5 of the Health and Safety Code, local amendments must be
based on climatic, geologic and topographical conditions. The following findings address each of
these situations and present the local conditions which, either singularly or in combination, justify the
amendments to be adopted:

Ordinance No.
Page 2 of 18



A. CLIMATE: The City, on average, experiences an approximate annual rainfall of 40
inches. This rainfall can normally be expected between October and April. During the
winter months, the City may experience periods of heavy rain, which causes local
flooding. Winter storms are often accompanied by high winds, which have uprooted
trees and damaged power lines. The City has also experienced periods of heavy fog,
which has delayed the responding fire apparatus and prevented early discovery of
structure fires. During the dry period, temperatures range from 70 degrees to over 100
degrees. These temperatures are often accompanied by light to gusty winds, which
when coupled with highly flammable vegetation, can cause uncontrollable fires. With
increased development spreading into the brush covered foothill area, wind driven fires
could have severe consequences, as has been demonstrated on several occasions
throughout the state.

B. GEOLOGIC: The City is susceptible to seismic hazards resulting from movement
along any one of several known faults in the area. The most serious direct earthquake
hazard threat is from the damage or collapse of buildings and other structures due to
ground movement. In addition to damage caused by earthquakes, there is the
possibility of earthquake-induced fires starting because of damage to gas lines, power
lines or heat producing appliances and the unavailability of water for fire control due to
broken water mains. In the event of a major earthquake many areas of the City may
not be accessible to emergency equipment and, if bridges or roads are damaged, the
City may be isolated from outside assistance.

C. TOPOGRAPHICAL.: The City is divided by Highway 101 and railroad right-of-way.
The railroad and freeway create barriers, which obstruct traffic patterns and delay
response time for fire equipment. The water supply within the City is directly affected
by the topographical layout. The City water system is currently pressured from the
Sonoma County Water Agency aqueduct inter-tie. In the event of a major catastrophe,
the City does not have an elevated water storage system to supply pressured water to
the City fire hydrants.

D. SUMMARY: The above local climatic, geologic and topographical conditions
increase the magnitude, exposure, accessibility problems and fire hazards presented to
the City of Cotati. A fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater
loss of life and damage than the earthquake itself. The majority of the City’s industrial
areas are located in the highest seismic risk zones, which also contain the largest
concentration of hazardous materials. Hazardous materials, particularly toxic gases,
could pose the greatest threat to the largest number of persons, should a significant
seismic event occur. The City of Cotati’s resources would have to be prioritized to
mitigate the greatest threat, and may be unavailable for vegetation or structure fires.

Other variables that may tend to intensify the situation include:

1. The extent of damage to the water system;
2. The extent of isolation due to bridge and/or freeway overpass collapse;

Ordinance No.
Page 3 of 18



3. The extent of roadway damage and/or amount of debris blocking

roadways;

Climatic conditions (hot, dry weather with high winds);

Time of day will influence the amount of traffic on roadways and could

intensify the risk to life during normal business hours; and,

6. The availability of timely mutual aid or assistance from the neighboring
departments which will likely have similar emergencies at the same
time.

7. The large portions of dwelling with wood shingle roof coverings, which
will increase the likelihood of conflagrations.

SRR

E. CONCLUSION: Local climatic, geologic and topographical conditions impact fire
suppression efforts and the frequency, spread, intensity, and the size of fire involving
structures in this community. Further, they impact potential damage to all structures
from earthquake and subsequent fire. Therefore, it is found to be necessary that the
California Building Standard Code Title 24 be amended to mitigate the effects of these
conditions.

14.04.030 California Administrative Code

2010 Edition of the California Administrative Code also known as the California Building
Standards Administration Code as published by the Building Standard Commission is adopted by
reference.

14.04.040 The California Building Code

The Council hereby adopts by reference the California Code of Regulations Title-24 Part 2 Volume
1 and 2 and the current edition of the International Building Code, the 2010 Edition Volumes 1, and 2
and the Appendices thereof as published by the International Code Council, including the generic fire-
resistive assemblies listed Fire Resistive Design Manual GA-600, published by the Gypsum
Association, as referenced in table numbers 720.1, 720.2 and 720.3 of the specified International
Building Code including the Appendix Chapter J,H and Chapter I, with the following amendments:

1. Chapter 1 Section 105.2, exception 1 shall be amended to read as follows: One-story
detached accessory buildings used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses, and similar uses,
provided the floor area does not exceed 120 square feet, (1 1.15m2). The height of the one
story detached accessory building shall not exceed 12 feet at any point or as specified by local
zoning ordinance.

2. Chapter 1 Section 10.5.2, exception 6 shall be amended to read as follows:
Platforms, decks, sidewalks, and driveways not more than 30

inches (762mm) above adjacent grade, not over any basement or story below

and are not part of an accessible route.

3. Chapter 1 Section 109.4 shall be amended to read as follows: Work commencing
before permit issuance. Any person who commences any work on a building, structure,

Ordinance No.
Page 4 of 18



electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system before obtaining the necessary permits shall be
subject to a fee establish by the building official that shall be in addition to the required
permit fees. An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall be collected whether or
not a permit is then or subsequently issued. The investigation fee shall be at least equal to and
not to exceed five time the permit fee required by this code. The minimum investigation fee
shall be set forth in the fee schedule adopted by this jurisdiction. The payment of such
investigation fee shall not exempt any person from compliance with all other provisions
of this code nor from any penalty prescribed by law.

4. Chapter 1 Section 109.7 shall be amended to read as follows:  Reinspections. A
reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or reinspection when such portion of
work for which inspection is called isnot  complete or when corrections called for are not
made.

This section is not to be interpreted as requiring reinspection fees the firsttime  ajob
is rejected for failure to comply with the requirements of this code, but as controlling the
practice of calling for inspections before the job is ready for such inspection or re-inspection.

Reinspection fees may be assessed when the inspection record card is not posted or
otherwise available on the work site, or the approved plans are not readily available to
the inspector. For failure to provide access on the date for which inspection is
requested, or for deviating from plans requiring the approval of the building official.

To obtain a reinspection, the applicant shall file an application therefore in writing on a
form furnished for that purpose and pay the reinspection fee in accordance with Table 1
or as set forth in the fee schedule adopted by the jurisdiction.

In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of the
work will be performed until the required fees have been paid.

5. Chapter 1 Section 109.8 shall be amended to read as follows: Violation penalties.
Any persons who violates a provision of this code or fails to comply with any of the
requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a building or structure
in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the building
official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be
subject to penalties as prescribed by law. An investigation fee, in addition to the
permit fee, shall be collected whether or not a permit is then or subsequently issued.
The investigation fee shall be at least equal to and not to exceed five time the permit
fee required by this code. The minimum investigation fee shall be set forth in the fee
schedule adopted by this jurisdiction. The payment of such investigation fee shall not
exempt any person from compliance with all other provisions of this code nor from any
penalty prescribed by law.

Chapter 5 General Height and Areas is amended as follows:

Ordinance No.
Page 5 of 18



Section 501.2 shall read as follows: Approved address numbers shall be
provided for all new building in such a position as to be plainly visible and
legible from the street fronting the property or as approved by the Building
Official or Fire Chief. Approved address shall be lighted, either internally or
externally to ensure plain visibility. These numbers shall contrast with their
background. Address numbers shall be Arabic numerals or alphabetical letters.
Numbers shall be a minimum of 4 inches (102 mm) high with a minimum
stroke width of 0.5 inch (12.7 mm).

14.04.050 The California Residential Code

Adoption of California Code Of Regulations Title 24, Part 2.5: 2010 California Residential
Building Code. 2009 Edition as published by the International Conference of Building Officials,
with the following amendments:

Section 105.2 Part 11 is adopted with the following amendments

1.

Chapter 1 Section 105.2, exception 1. Shall be revised to read as follows: One-story detached
accessory buildings used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses, and similar uses, provided the
floor area does not exceed 120 square feet, (1 1.15m2). The height of the one story detached
accessory building shall not exceed 12 feet at any point or as specified by local zoning
ordinance.

Chapter 1 Section 105.2, exception 6. Platforms, decks,
sidewalks, and driveways not more than 30 inches (762mm) above adjacent grade, not over
any basement or story below and are not part of an accessible route.

Chapter 1 Section 108.6 Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who
commences any work on a building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system
before obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject to a fee establish by the building
official that shall be in addition to the required permit fees. An investigation fee, in addition to
the permit fee, shall be collected whether or not a permit is then or subsequently issued. The
investigation fee shall be at least equal to and not to exceed five time the permit fee required
by this code. The minimum investigation fee set forth in the fee schedule adopted by this
jurisdiction. The payment of such investigation fee shall not exempt any person from
compliance with all other provisions of this code nor from any penalty prescribed by law.

Add New Section

4.

Chapter 1 Section 108.7 Reinspections. A reinspection fee may be assessed for each
inspection or reinspection when such portion of work for which inspection is called is not
complete or when corrections called for are not made.

Ordinance No.
Page 6 of 18



This section is not to be interpreted as requiring reinspection fees the first time a job is rejected
for failure to comply with the requirements of this code, but as controlling the practice of
calling for inspections before the job is ready for such inspection or re-inspection.

Reinspection fees may be assessed when the inspection record card is not posted or otherwise
available on the work site, the approved plans are not readily available to the inspector. For
failure to provide access on the date for which inspection is requested, or for deviating from
plans requiring the approval of the building official.

To obtain a reinspection, the applicant shall file an application therefore in writing on a form
furnished for that purpose and pay the reinspection fee in accordance with Table 1 or as set
forth in the fee schedule adopted by the jurisdiction.

In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of the work
will be performed until the required fees have been paid.

Add New Section

5. Chapter 1 Section 108.8 Violation penalties. Any persons who violates a provision of this
code or fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or
repairs a building or structure in violation of the approved construction documents or directive
of the building official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code,
shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by law. An investigation fee, in addition to the
permit fee, shall be collected whether or not a permit is then or subsequently issued. The
investigation fee shall be at least equal to and not to exceed five time the permit fee required
by this code. The minimum investigation fee set forth in the fee schedule adopted by this
jurisdiction. The payment of such investigation fee shall not exempt any person from
compliance with all other provisions of this code nor from any penalty prescribed by law.

Add new section
Section R908 Solar Photovoltaic Panels/Modules

R908.1 Solar photovoltaic panels/modules. Solar photovoltaic panels/modules shall comply with
the requirements of this code and the California Fire Code.

R313.2 has been amended to read

R313.2 Where Required. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed and maintained in
all newly constructed buildings throughout.

Exceptions:
I. Detached Group U occupancies 1,000 sqg. ft. or less. Agricultural exempt
buildings and agricultural buildings as approved by the Fire Code Official.

Ordinance No.
Page 7 of 18



ii. Detached pool houses up to 1,000 sg. ft. in floor area within 50 feet of the
pool and limited to a single bathroom.

iii. A room above a detached garage used for storage only that does not
contain a bathroom, cooking or refrigeration facilities or connections for such facilities.

Iv. Car ports of non-combustible construction.

R313.2.2 Additions

Additions-Residential. Additions to existing residential buildings that increase the square footage by
50% or greater shall meet the requirements for a newly constructed building. All additions to
residential buildings with an existing approved automatic sprinkler system shall be required to extend
the sprinkler system into the addition per section R313.2

Section 313.2.3 is added to read:

R313.2.3 Alterations and remodels.

Remodels, Alterations, or Repairs. All existing buildings and facilities when remodels, alterations
or structural repairs are made involving demolition, remodel, or repair of more than 50% of the
structure or when the total cost of remodels, alterations or structural repairs, exceeds the valuation
threshold of $50,000, based on January 1981, “ENR US20 Cities” Average construction Cost Index of
3372.02 (Engineering News Record, McGraw Hill Publishing Company) shall meet the requirements
for a newly constructed building. The enforcing agency shall annually update the valuation threshold
to a current amount based on the increase in the index since the last figure used. (For example, the
January 2010 amount is $128,410.86)

14.04.060 The California Electric Code
The 2010 Edition of the California Electric Code and appendices as published by the National Fire

Protection Association, incorporating by adoption of the 2008 Edition of the National Electric Code is
adopted by reference with California Amendments adopted by reference and is amended as follows:

Delete All Fee Schedules. Fee schedules shall be adopted by separate resolution of the city
council.

14.04.070 The California Mechanical Code

The 2010 Edition of the California Mechanical Code and appendices as published by the
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, incorporating by adoption of the
2006 Edition of the Uniform Mechanical Code with California Amendments is adopted by reference
including Appendix Chapters A, B, C and D and is amended to read as follows:

Delete All Fee Schedules. Fee schedules shall be adopted by separate resolution of the city
council.

14.04.080 The California Plumbing Code

Ordinance No.
Page 8 of 18



The 2010 Edition of the California Plumbing Code and appendices as published by the
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, incorporating by adoption of the
2006 Edition of the Uniform Plumbing Code with California Amendments is adopted by reference
including Appendix Chapters A, B, D, and K and is amended to read as follows:

Delete All Fee Schedules. Fee schedules shall be adopted by separate resolution of the city
council.

14.04.090 Edition of the California Energy Code

2010 Edition of the California Energy Code as published by the California Building Standards
Commission and is adopted by reference.

14.04.100 The California Historical Building Code
2010 Edition, as published by the California Building Standards Commission.

14.04.110 The California Fire Code
Chapter 1 ADMINISTRATION

Section 101.1 Shall be revised to read: These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the City
of Cotati, hereinafter referred to as “this code”

Add New Section

Section 104.2.1 Application for Permit Fees: All applications for a permit required by this Code
shall be made to the Bureau of Fire Prevention in such form and detail, as it shall prescribe.
Applications for permits shall be accompanied such plans as are required by the Bureau. The City
Council may establish fees by resolution for permit applications.

Add New Section

105.7.14 Solar photovoltaic power systems. A construction permit is required to install or modify
Solar photovoltaic power systems.

Add New Section

Section 109.3.2 Citations. The Chief is authorized to issue a citation to persons operating or
maintaining an occupancy, premise, or vehicle subject to this code, who allows a hazard to exist or fail
to take immediate action to abate a hazard on such occupancy, premises, or vehicle when ordered or
notified to do so.

Chapter 2 DEFINITIONS

Ordinance No.
Page 9 of 18



Section 202 Wherever the word “jurisdiction” is used in the 2010 California Fire Code and 2009
International Fire Code, it shall be understand to mean that the Rancho Adobe Fire District is the local
fire authority having jurisdiction (AHJ).

Section 202 Where the party responsible for the enforcement of the 2010 California Fire Code and
2009 International Fire Code is given the title of “fire marshal,” add the following definition:

FIRE MARSHAL is the chief of the bureau of fire prevention
Amend Chapter 3 General Precautions to read:

Section 307.1.2 is added to read Open Burning. Open burning within the City limits of Cotati,
including incinerators of all types, is prohibited, except for agricultural burning permitted by the Bay
Area Air Quality Management District.

EXCEPTION: Barbecues used for cooking purposes, provided the barbecues shall not be used for
burning rubbish, paper, boxes, grass, brush or other combustible items, except charcoal, natural gas or
other materials commonly used in barbecues for cooking purposes.

Section 304.1.2.1 is added to read:

304.1.2.1 Vegetation non developed parcel. Any parcel that is next to a developed parcel and is a
threat to a structure shall be required to maintain a minimum 20 feet of clearance on the property line
adjacent to the structure.

Exemptions: When approved by the Fire Code Official or if a hazard does not exist

Amend CHAPTER 5 FIRE SERVICE FEATURES to read as follows:
Section 505.1.1 is amended to read:

505.1.1 Size and Width.
i.  Commercial Buildings shall be 12” inches in height with 1” inch (24.5mm) stroke. Suite
Numbers shall be six (6”) inches in height and % inches (12.7mm) stroke.
ii.  Residential Buildings shall be 4” inches in height and 3/8 inches (9.525mm) stroke.
Exception: All sizes can be reduced with the approval of the fire code official.

Add new section
605.11 SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC POWER SYSTEMS

Solar photovoltaic power systems shall be installed in accordance with this code, the California
Building Code and California Electric Code.

Exception: Detached Group U non-habitable structures such as parking shade structures,
carports, solar trellises, and similar type structures are not subject to the requirements of this
section.

Ordinance No.
Page 10 of 18



605.11.1 Marking. Marking is required on all interior and exterior dc conduit, enclosures, raceways,
cable assemblies, junction boxes, combiner boxes, and disconnects.

605.11.1.1 Materials. The materials used for marking shall be reflective, weather resistant and
suitable for the environment. Marking as required in sections 605.11.1.1 through 605.11.1.4 shall have
all letters capitalized with a minimum height of 3/8 inch (9.5 mm) white on red background.

605.11.1.2 Marking content. The marking shall contain the words “WARNING: PHOTOVOLTAIC
POWER SOURCE”

605.11.1.3 Main service disconnect. The marking shall be placed adjacent to the main service
disconnect in a location clearly visible from the location where the disconnect is operated.

605.11.1.4 Location of Marking. Marking shall be placed on all interior and exterior dc _conduit,
raceways, enclosures and cable assemblies every 10 feet (3048 mm) within 1 foot (305 mm) of
all turns or bends and within 1 foot (305 mm) above and below all penetrations of roof/ceiling
assemblies and all walls and /or barriers.

605.11.2 Locations of DC conductors. Conduit, wiring systems, and raceways for photovoltaic
circuits shall be located as close as possible to the ridge or hip or valley and from the hip or valley as
directly as possible to an outside wall to reduce trip hazards and maximize ventilation opportunities.
Conduit runs between sub arrays and to DC combiner boxes shall be installed in a manner that
minimizes total amount of conduit on the roof by taking the shortest path from the array to the DC
combiner box. The DC combiner boxes shall be located such that conduit runs are minimized in the
pathways between arrays. DC wiring shall be run in metallic conduit or raceways when located within
enclosed spaces in a building. Conduit shall run along the bottom of load bearing members.

605.11.3 Access and pathways. Roof access, pathways, and spacing requirements shall be provided in
order to ensure access to the roof; provide pathways to specific areas of the roof; provide for smoke
ventilation operations; and to provide emergency egress from the roof.

Exceptions:
1. Requirements relating to ridge, hip, and valleys do not apply to roofs slopes of

two units vertical in twelve units horizontal (2:12) or less.
2. Residential structures shall be designed so that each array is no greater than 150
feet (45 720 mm) by 150 feet (45 720 mm) in either axis.
3. The fire chief may allow panels/modules to be located up to the ridge when an
alternative ventilation method acceptable to the fire chief has been provided or
where the fire chief has determined vertical ventilation techniques will not be

employed.

Ordinance No.
Page 11 of 18



605.11.3.1 Roof access points. Roof access points shall be defined as an area that does not place
ground ladders over openings such as windows or doors, and are located at strong points of building
construction in locations where the access point does not conflict with overhead obstructions such as
tree limbs, wires, or signs.

605.11.3.2 Residential systems for one- and two-family residential dwellings. Access shall be
provided in accordance with Sections 605.11.3.2.1 through 605.11.3.2.4

605.11.3.2.1 Residential buildings with hip roof layouts. Panels /modules shall be located in a
manner that provides a 3 foot (914 mm) wide clear access pathway from the eave to the ridge on each
roof slope where panels/modules are located. The access pathway shall be located at a structurally
strong location on the building capable of supporting the live load of fire fighters accessing the roof.

605.11.3.2.2 Residential buildings with a single ridge. Panels/modules shall be located in a manner
that provides two 3 foot (914 mm) wide access pathways from the eave to the ridge on each roof slope
where panels/modules are located.

605.11.3.2.3 Hips and Valleys: Panels/modules shall be located no closer than 18 inches (457 mm) to
a hip or a valley if panels/modules are to be placed on both sides of a hip or valley. If the panels are to
be located on only one side of a hip or valley that is of equal length then the panels shall be permitted
to be placed directly adjacent to the hip or valley.

605.11.3.2.4 Smoke Ventilation. Panels/modules shall be located no higher than 3 feet (914 mm)
below the ridge in order to allow for fire department smoke ventilation operations.

605.11.3.3 All other occupancies. Access shall be provided in accordance with Sections 605.11.3.3.1
through 605.11.3.3.3.

Exception: Where it is determined by the fire code official that the roof
configuration is similar to a one- or two-family dwelling, the fire code
official may approve the residential access and ventilation requirements
provided in 605.11.3.2.1 through 605.11.3.2.4.

605.11.3.3.1 Access. There shall be a minimum 6 foot (1829 mm) wide clear perimeter around the
edges of the roof.

Exception: If either axis of the building is 250 feet (76 200 mm) or less,
there shall be a minimum 4 foot (1290 mm) wide clear perimeter around
the edges of the roof.

605.11.3.3.2 Pathways. The solar installation shall be designed to provide designated pathways. The
pathways shall meet the following requirements:

Ordinance No.
Page 12 of 18



1. The pathway shall be over areas capable of supporting the live load of
fire fighters accessing the roof

2. The center line axis pathways shall be provided in both axis of the
roof. Center line axis pathways shall run where the roof structure is
capable of supporting the live load of firefighters accessing the roof.

3. Shall be straight line not less than 4 feet (1290 mm) clear to skylights
and/or ventilation hatches

4. Shall be straight line not less than 4 feet (1290 mm) clear to roof
standpipes

5. Shall provide not less than 4 feet (1290 mm) clear around roof access
hatch with at least one not less than 4 feet (1290 mm) clear pathway to
parapet or roof edge

605.11.3.3.3 Smoke Ventilation. The solar installation shall be designed to meet the following
requirements:

1. Arrays shall be no greater than 150 feet (45 720 mm) by 150 feet (45
720 mm) in distance in either axis in order to create opportunities for
smoke ventilation operations.

2. Smoke ventilation options between array sections shall be one of the
following:

2.1. A pathway 8 feet (2438 mm) or greater in width;

2.2 A 4 feet (1290 mm) or greater in width pathway and bordering
roof skylights or smoke and heat vents:

2.3 A 4 feet (1290 mm) or greater in width pathway and bordering 4
foot (1290 mm) x 8 foot (2438 mm) “venting cutouts” every 20 feet
(6096 mm) on alternating sides of the pathway

605.11.4 Ground mounted photovoltaic arrays. Ground mounted photovoltaic arrays shall comply
with Sections 605.11 through 605.11.2 and this section. Setback requirements do not apply to ground-
mounted, free standing photovoltaic arrays. A clear brush area of 10 feet (3048 mm) is required for
ground mounted photovoltaic arrays.

Chapter 9 Fire Protection Systems
Section 902 is amended to add the following definitions

EMERGENCY is an occasion that reasonably calls for a response by the fire department. A
response due to failure of an alarm system or to personnel error is not an emergency.

Ordinance No.
Page 13 of 18



FALSE ALARM is an alarm signal necessitating response by the fire department when an
emergency does not exist.

Section 903 is amended to read as follows:
Section 903.2.1 is deleted and replaced to read:

Section 903.2.1 Additions shall be required to meet the requirements of a newly constructed
building per section 903.2 as provided in sections 903.2.1.1 and 903.2.1.2

903.2.1.1 Additions-Commercial. Additions to existing commercial buildings that increase square
footage by 25% or greater shall meet the requirements for a newly constructed building. All additions
to commercial buildings with an existing approved automatic sprinkler system shall be required to
extend the sprinkler system into the addition.

903.2.1.2 Additions-Residential. Additions to existing residential buildings that increase the square
footage by 50% or greater shall meet the requirements for a newly constructed building. All additions
to residential buildings with an existing approved automatic sprinkler system shall be required to
extend the sprinkler system into the addition.

903.2.2 Remodels, Alterations, or Repairs. All existing buildings and facilities when remodels,
alterations or structural repairs are made involving demolition, remodel, or repair of more than 50% of
the structure or when the total cost of remodels, alterations or structural repairs, exceeds the valuation
threshold of $50,000, based on January 1981, “ENR US20 Cities” Average construction Cost Index of
3372.02 (Engineering News Record, McGraw Hill Publishing Company) shall meet the requirements
for a newly constructed building. The enforcing agency shall annually update the valuation threshold
to a current amount based on the increase in the index since the last figure used. (For example, the
January 2010 amount is $128,410.86)

Section 903.2.3 is deleted and replaced to read:

903.2.3 Changes of Occupancy. Any change of occupancy when the proposed new occupancy
classification is more hazardous based on life and fire risk, as determined by the Fire Code Official,
including the conversion of residential buildings to condominiums, the building shall meet the
requirements for a newly constructed building.

Section 903.2.5 is deleted and replaced to read:

903.2.5 Remodels, Alterations, or Repairs

Remodels, Alterations, or Repairs. All existing buildings and facilities when remodels, alterations
or structural repairs are made involving demolition, remodel, or repair of more than 50% of the
structure or when the total cost of remodels, alterations or structural repairs, exceeds the valuation
threshold of $50,000, based on January 1981, “ENR US20 Cities” Average construction Cost Index of
3372.02 (Engineering News Record, McGraw Hill Publishing Company) shall meet the requirements
for a newly constructed building. The enforcing agency shall annually update the valuation threshold
to a current amount based on the increase in the index since the last figure used. (For example, the
January 2010 amount is $128,410.86)

Ordinance No.
Page 14 of 18



Subsections 903.2.4 through 903.2.13 are deleted.

903.3 Installation Requirements. Sprinkler systems shall be installed in accordance with NFPA 13,
NFPA 13R if approved by the Fire Code Official and NFPA 13D.

Sections 903.3.1 is amended to read:

903.3.1 Design Criteria. Fire sprinkler systems installed in buildings of an undetermined use
shall be designed and installed to have a design density of .33 gallons per minute per square
foot over a minimum design area of 3000 square feet. Where a subsequent occupancy change
requires a system with greater capacity, it shall be the building owner’s responsibility to
upgrade the system to the required density.

907.1.5 False Alarms.

a. EMERGENCY is an occasion that reasonably calls for a response by the fire
department. A response due to failure of an alarm system or to personnel error is not an
emergency.

b. FALSE ALARM is an alarm signal necessitating response by the fire
department when an emergency does not exist.

907.1.6 is amended to read:

907.1.6 Notice of False Alarm. The chief shall determine whether an emergency exists at the
time the fire department responds to an alarm signal from a fire alarm system. If the chief
determines that an emergency does not exist, the chief shall issue a written notice of false alarm
to the owner or person in charge or control of the facility where the alarm signal originated.

907.1.7 is amended to read:

907.1.7 Hearing on Notice. Any person receiving a notice of false alarm who contends that the
chief erroneously determined that an emergency did not exist may file a written request with the
chief for a hearing on the determination within ten (10) days after receipt of the notice of false
alarm. The chief shall give the requesting party a hearing on the determination within thirty (30)
days of receipt of the request. The request shall set forth: (1) why an emergency existed, or (2)
why the false alarm resulted from an act of God, flooding, or other violent natural condition
without fault and beyond the control of the requesting party. Within ten (10) days following the
hearing, the chief shall give written notice of his or her decision to the requesting party.

907.1.8 is amended to read:
907.1.8 Unreliable Fire Alarm Systems. The chief may determine a fire alarm system to be

unreliable upon receipt of more than four (4) false alarms within a twelve (12) month period.
Upon finding that an alarm system is unreliable, the chief may order the following:

Ordinance No.
Page 15 of 18



a. Upon the fifth (5th) and sixth (6th) false alarms from the alarm system within a
twelve (12) month period, the system owner shall pay a mitigation fee to the fire department of
$150.00, plus the cost of fire engine response, as specified in the fire department’s approved fee
ordinance, for each occurrence.

b. 2. Upon the seventh (7th) and eighth (8th) false alarms from the alarm system
within a twelve (12) month period, the system owner shall pay a mitigation fee to the fire
department of $300.00, plus the cost of fire engine response, as specified in the fire
department’s approved fee ordinance for each occurrence.

c. 3. Upon the ninth (9th) and following false alarms from the alarm system within
a twelve (12) month period, the system owner shall pay a mitigation fee to the fire department
of $500.00, plus the cost of fire engine response, as specified in the fire department’s approved
fee ordinance, for each occurrence. The chief may, in addition, require the system owner to
provide standby personnel as defined by Section 2501.18 or take such other measures, as the
chief deems appropriate. Persons or activities required by the chief shall remain in place until a
fire department approved fire alarm maintenance firm certifies in writing to the chief that the
alarm system has been restored to a reliable condition. The chief may require such tests, as he
deems necessary to demonstrate the adequacy of the system.

Chapter 14 Fire Safety during Construction and Demolition
Section 1414.3 is amended to read:

1414.3 Large building sprinkler protections

Building in excess of three stories in height or having a first story in excess on 100,000 square feet in
area shall provide an approved operating fire sprinkler system on each floor during construction prior
to continuing construction on upper stories.

14.04.120 California Existing Building Code

California Code of Regulations Title 24 Part 10 California Existing Building Code 2007 Edition
as published by the International Code Conference International Existing Building Code Appendix
Chapter Al and is adopted by reference.

14.04.130 California Green Building Standards Code

The 2010 Edition of the California Green Building Standards as published by the International
Code Conference with the following amendments Appendix Chapters A4 Tier 1 and Appendix
Chapter A5 Tier 1.

Amend Chapter 2 Definitions

Section 202 is amended to read:

Newly Constructed (or New Construction) A newly constructed building (or new construction)
includes additions of over 500 square feet for residential construction or 1800 square feet for non
residential construction, alterations or repairs of 50 percent or greater to any existing building.

Amend Appendix A4 Residential Voluntary Measures to read as follows:

Ordinance No.
Page 16 of 18



Division A4.6
A406.601.1 The Tier 1 measures contained in this appendix are adopted as mandatory provisions.
Amend Appendix Chapter A5 Nonresidential Voluntary Measures to read as follows:
Division A5
A506.601.1 The Tier 1 measures contained in this appendix are adopted as mandatory provisions.

14.04.140 California Reference Standard Code

The 2010 Edition of the California Reference Standard Code published by the California Building
Standard Commission is adopted by reference.

14.04.150 International Existing Building Code

The 2006 Edition of the International Existing Building Code as published by International Code
Council is adopted by reference.

14.04.160 Enforcement of Fire Codes

The 2010 California Fire Code and 2009 International Fire Code as adopted and amended herein
shall be enforced by the bureau of fire prevention, in the fire department of Rancho Adobe Fire
District.

14.04.170 Non-Liability of City of Cotati

This Ordinance shall not be construed as imposing upon the City of Cotati (or any official or
employee thereof) any liability or responsibility for damages to any property or injuries to any person
resulting from defects in building construction, defective plumbing, or drainage systems (or
installations thereof), electrical or gas installations, or by installations of containers for the use of
flammable products, nor shall the City of Cotati (or any official or employee thereof) be liable or
responsible for any property damage from any cause whatsoever including but not limited to that
which may have been caused by a gas leakage, fire or explosion of any gas appliance or house gas
piping, electrical application or electrical wiring or from the storage or use of flammable and/or
hazardous materials (14.04.160).

Non-Liability of Rancho Adobe Fire District. This Ordinance shall not be construed as imposing upon
the Rancho Adobe Fire District (or any official or employee thereof) any liability or responsibility for
damages to any property or injuries to any person resulting from defects in fire protection systems, or
installation of containers for the use of flammable products, nor shall the Rancho Adobe Fire District
(or any official or employee thereof) be liable or responsible for any property damage from any cause
whatsoever including but not limited to that which may have been caused by a gas leakage, fire or
explosion of any gas appliance or house gas piping, electrical application or electrical wiring or from
the storage or use of flammable and/or hazardous materials.

14.04.180 Violations and Penalties

Any person violating any of the provisions of this Ordinance shall be deemed guilty of an infraction
and any person violating the same section or a portion of an Ordinance on a second or subsequent
occasion shall thereafter be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and upon conviction of either an

Ordinance No.
Page 17 of 18



infraction or a misdemeanor shall be punishable by law. The imposition of one penalty for any
violation shall not excuse the violation or permit to continue; and all such persons shall be required to
correct or remedy such violations or defects within a reasonable time; and when not otherwise
specified, each ten days that prohibited conditions are maintained shall constitute a separate offense.

14.04.190 Repeal of Conflicting Ordinances
All other Ordinances or parts of Ordinances in conflict with this Ordinance are hereby repealed.

14.04.200 Fees
The City Council of the City of Cotati may establish permit fees as set forth by resolution.

Section 2: Severability. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase or portion of this
ordinance is for any reason held invalid or unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity
of the remaining portions of this ordinance. The City Council hereby declares that it would have
passed this and each section, subsection, phrase or clause thereof irrespective of the fact that any one
or more sections, subsections, sentence, clause, phrase or potion of this ordinance be declared
unconstitutional on their face or as applied.

Section 3: Effective Date. This Ordinance shall become effective and be in full force and effect
thirty days (30) days after its final passage.

Section 4: Posting. The City clerk shall cause this ordinance to be published and/or posted within
fifteen (15) days after its adoption in accordance with Section 36933 of the Government Code of the
State of California.

IT IS HEREBY CERTIFIED that the foregoing ordinance was duly introduced and legally adopted
at a regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Cotati held on the 23" day of March, 2011 by
the following vote, to wit:

ORCHARD
HARVEY
COLEMAN-SENGHOR
GILARDI
LANDMAN
Approved:

Janet Orchard, Mayor

Attest:

Tamara Taylor, Deputy City Clerk

Approved as to form:

Rich Rudnansky, City Attorney

Ordinance No.
Page 18 of 18



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF COTATI

ADDING A NEW CHAPTER 14.06 TO TITLE 14 OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE
RELATING TO REPAIR OF DAMAGED STRUCTURES.

An ordinance for the City of Cotati to establish regulations for the repair or reconstruction of
damaged structures.

A. Recitals.

(i.) Article 2 of Chapter 1 of Part 1 of Division 1 of Title 5 of the Government Code
8 50020, et.Seq. requires a local agency to take legislative action by ordinance to
adopt by reference the most current edition of the California Building Codes &
International Codes, and the Uniform Codes.

(ii.)  Article 2 of Chapter 1 of Part 1 of Division 1 of Title 5 of the Government
Code, 8 50022.6 requires that at least one copy of the primary adopted code shall be
filed with the office of the city clerk of the legislative body at least 15 days
preceding the hearing and shall be kept there for public viewing while the ordinance
is in force.

(iii))  Article 2 of Chapter 1 of Part 1 of Division 1 of Title 5 of the
Government Code, 850022.3 requires that after the first reading of the title of the
adopting ordinance and of the title of the code to be adopted thereby, and of the title
of the secondary codes therein adopted by reference, the legislative body shall
schedule a public hearing thereon

The City Council of the City of Cotati ordains as follows:
B. Ordinance.

Now THEREFORE, the City Council of the City of Cotati does hereby find, determine and
ordain as follows:

SECTION 1. In all aspects, as set forth the Recitals, Part A, of this Ordinance.

SECTION 2. One (1) certified copy of each of the Codes so adopted, along with any
Amendment thereto, shall be kept on file for the use and examination by the public and located
at the City Clerk’s Office at the City of Cotati City Hall.

SECTION 3. Chapter 14.06 is added to Building and Construction Division of Title1l4 of
the City of Cotati municipal code, to read:

SECTION 15.10 Adoption and Intent

This chapter establishes regulations as amendments to the building code for the expeditious
repair of damaged structures. In the event an amendment to the California Building
Standards Code results in differences between these building standards and the California



Building Standards Code, the text of these building standards shall govern. In accordance with
California Health and Safety Code Section 17958.7, express findings that modifications to the
California Building Standards Code are reasonably necessary because of local climatic,
geological or topographical conditions are either already on file with the California
Building Standards Commission, or will be filed prior to the effective date of the ordinance
codified in this Article. In accordance with California Government Code Section 50022.6, at least
one true copy of the California Building Code has been on file with the City Clerk since
fifteen (15) days prior to enactment of the ordinance codified in this Article. While this
Article is in force, a true copy of this Chapter shall be kept for public use and examination in
the City Clerk’s Office at the City of Cotati City Hall.

Section 14.06.1

For the purposes of this Chapter, the following section is added as a new subsection to Section
3401 of the 2010 California Building Code:

3401.4 Alternative compliance. Work performed in accordance with the International
Existing Building Code shall be deemed to comply with the provisions of this chapter.

SECTION 4. Repeal of Conflicting Ordinances.

All other Ordinances or parts of Ordinances in conflict with this Ordinance are hereby repealed.
SECTION 5. Fees.

The City Council of the City of Cotati may establish permit fees as set forth by resolution.
SECTION 6. Findings of Fact.

Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 17958.7, the Finding of Fact, as submitted in
Exhibit A of this Ordinance, are made in connection with the adoption of revisions or additions
to the 2010 editions of the California Building Code, Fire Code, Plumbing, Mechanical and
Electrical Codes .

SECTION 7. Effective Date. This Ordinance shall become effective 30 days after the second
reading.

IT IS HEREBY CERTIFIED that the foregoing ordinance was duly introduced and legally
adopted at a regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Cotati held on the
[To be inserted by Deputy City Clerk] day of [To be inserted by Deputy City Clerk],
20[To be inserted by Deputy City Clerk] by the following vote, to wit:

Ordinance No.
Page 2 of 3



ORCHARD

HARVEY

COLEMAN-SENGHOR

GILARDI

LANDMAN

Approved:

Janet Orchard, Mayor
Attest:
Tamara Taylor, Deputy City Clerk

Approved as to form:

Approved:

Mayor

ATTEST:

City Clerk

Rich Rudnansky, City Attorney

Ordinance No.
Page 3 of 3



Item No. 3

City Council Agenda
Consent Calendar

Subject: Resolution Accepting the Park Improvements for Santero Way Park and
Accepting the Offer of Dedication
Date: March 23, 2011

Written by: Marsha Sue Lustig, Assistant to the City Manager

Recommendation

It is recommended that the City Council adopt a resolution accepting the park improvements for
Santero Way Park and accepting the Offer of Dedication.

Background

On January 11, 2006, the City Council adopted Resolution 06-02 (attached) in which the Council
accepted Parcel A- a Public Park as identified on the Final Map and accepted the Park
Improvements conditioned on a license agreement being entered into between the City and the
Homeowners Association. The Agreement required the Homeowners Association to maintain
certain private improvements located within a license area on Parcel A and to indemnify the City
as to any claims or actions arising out of the use of the license area and that the Homeowners
maintain liability insurance. Resolution 06-02 goes on to say that the license agreement was to be
recorded prior to the recordation of a copy of Resolution 06-02 and after the recordation of the
license agreement the City Clerk was directed to record a certified copy of Resolution 06-02
accepting the Public Park.

Analysis/Discussion

Attached to this staff report is the signed license agreement. Therefore, staff recommends that the
City Council adopt the attached resolution authorizing the City Manager to execute the License
Agreement and authorizing the recordation of the License Agreement, Resolution 06-02, as well
as this resolution.



City Council Staff Report
Accepting Park Improvements for Santero Way
March 23, 2011

Financial Considerations

None

Environmental Issues

None

Attachments:
1. Proposed resolution

2. License and Maintenance Agreement
3. Resolution 06-02

Page 2 of 2



RECORDING REQUESTED BY:
City Clerk

City of Cotati

201 W. Sierra Ave.

Cotati, CA 94931

WHEN RECORDED RETURN TO:
City Clerk

City of Cotati

201 W. Sierra Ave.

Cotati, CA 94931 No fee due for recordation pursuant to Gov’t. Code 86103

RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF COTATI
ACCEPTING THE PARK IMPROVEMENTS FOR SANTERO WAY PARK AND
ACCEPTING THE OFFER OF DEDICATION THEREOF

WHEREAS, The Colvin Group, LLC (TCG) did apply to the City for approval of a
subdivision map relating to APN 144-480-020 & 144-320-017 (the Project), and

WHEREAS, as part of said subdivision, TCG did offer for dedication upon the face of
the final map The Parcel identified as Parcel A — Public Park (the Park) as more particularly
described on the Final Map of Cotati Station Phase I, recorded in the office of the Sonoma
County Recorder at Book 654, Pages 44-49 (Map), and

WHEREAS, pursuant to the action of the City Council of the City of Cotati (Council) the offer
of dedication was conditionally accepted subject to the completion and acceptance of certain
improvements; and

WHEREAS, on January 11, 2006, the City Council of the City of Cotati did approve
Resolution No. 06-02, accepting the park improvements for Santero Way Park and accepting
the offer of dedication subject to certain conditions; and

WHEREAS, the City has now received the signed license agreement between the City
and the Santero Way Homeowner’s Association which meets the requirements of Resolution
06-02; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the City Council of the City of Cotati
accepts Parcel A — Public Park as identified on the Map and accepts the Park Improvements as
complete subject to the license agreement being recorded prior to the recordation of a copy of
this resolution accepting the Park

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City Council authorized the City Manager to execute
the License Agreement with the Santero Way Homeowners Association;

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that upon the recordation of this resolution Parcel A — Public
Park as identified on the Map and the improvements located thereon shall be accepted by the



City of Cotati and the City Clerk is hereby directed to record a certified copy of this Resolution
with the Sonoma County Recorder upon the satisfaction of the conditions set forth above.

E R I

IT ISHEREBY CERTIFIED that the foregoing resolution was duly introduced and legally
adopted at a regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Cotati held on the 23rd day of
March, 2011, by the following vote, to wit

ORCHARD

HARVEY
COLEMAN-SENGHOR
GILARDI

LANDMAN

Approved:

Janet Orchard, Mayor

Attest:
Tamara Taylor, Deputy City Clerk

Approved as to form:

Rich Rudnansky, City Attorney

Resolution No.
Page 2 of 2




Recording Requested by City of Cotati
And when recorded, return to:

City of Cotati

201 West Sietra Ave.
Cotati, CA 94931
Attention: City Manager

EXEMPT FROM RECORDING FEES PER
GOVERNMENT CODE §§6103, 27383

Space above this line reserved for recorder's use

THIS LICENSE AND MAINTENANCE AGREEMENT (the "Agreement") is
entered into by THE CITY OF COTATI, a public body (the "City") and SANTERO WAY
HOMEOWNERS ASSOCIATION, a Californis nonprofit mutual benefit corporation (the
"Association") with reference to the foliowing:

A. The Cotati Station Phase I Map was filed for record on September 25,2003 in
Book 654 of Maps at pages 44-49 in the records of Sononia County, California (the "Map"};
Parcel A as described on the Map was offered for dedication for public use and was accepted
by the City, subject to improvement, for public use;

. B. Certain "Private Improvements” as described in Exhibit A attached to this
Agreement that serve and benefit the condominiums that abut Parcel A were constructed on
the park site by developer within the portions of Parcel A subject to the Private Utility &
Private Drainage & Private Access Easements ("P.UP.D.P.A.E.") shown on the Map attached
hereto as Exhibit C (the "License Areas"). The condominiums are managed and maintained by
the Association.

C. The purposes of this Agreement are to:

1 describe the Association's rights and duties regarding the
maintenance and repair of the Private Improvements
situated within the License Areas; and

(if)  grant a license to allow the Private Improvements to be
retained within the License Areas.

THE CITY AND THE ASSOCIATION AGREE AS FOLLOWS:

i. License: The City grants to the Association a license over the License Areas
described in Recital B for:

{a) The right to retain Private Improvements situated within the License
Areas; and

b) Access by agents of the Association to inspect, maintain, repair and

-1-



replace the Private Improvements.

This license may only be revoked concurrently with the termination of the
Private. Utility & Private Drainage & Private Access Basements ("P.UP.D.P.AE") shown
on the Map. The Association shall not modify the Private Improvements or place any
additional structures, features or other improvements within the License Areas without the
express written consent of the City.

2. Maintenance: The Association covenants that it will maintain and repair the
Private Improvements in good condition and repair at all times. The arbor shall be maintained
in a structarally sound condition at all times. Any damage or deterioration in the wood
components shall be repaired or replaced and any rust on the metal components shall be
appropriately removed or treated. The walkways shall be maintained in accordance with a
maintenance standard that is equivalent or better than the maintenance standard used by the
City as described in Exhibit B-attached to this Agreement in maintaining the walkways within
those portions of Parcel A that are not within the License Areas. The City shall be responsible
for the- repair of any Private Improvements damaged by any act or occurrence of the City or
its agents.

All other improvements within Parcel A not within the License Areas are to
‘be maintained subject to available and appropriated funds by the City. The City also shall be
responsible for repairing any damage caused by acts of vandalism, and the periodic removal
of trash from this area.

3. City Enforcement Rights: If the City determines that the Association is not
maintaining the Private Improvements as required under Section 2, the City shall notify the
Association in writing (the “Maintenance Notice”). If the Association fails to take
appropriate steps to correct the problems identified in the Maintenance Notice within 30 days
of receipt of the Maintenance Notice, the City may, but shall not be obligated to, take the
necessary corrective measures. On receipt of written demand, the Association immediately
shall reimburse the City for its costs in taking the corrective measures.

4, Indemnification: The Association shall defend and indemnify the City for any
claims, actions or proceedings arising out of any willful or negligent act of the Association in
connection with the use or occupancy of the License Areas.

5, Insurance: The Association, at its sole cost, shall maintain commercial general
liability insurance against any liability incident to any bodily injury or property damage from
any accident or occurrence within the License Areas. The limits of such insurance shall not be
less than $1,000,000 covering the License Areas and the acts, errors and omissions of the
Association relating thereto. The City shall be named as an additional insured thereunder.

6. Amendments: This Agreement may be modified in any manner in a writing.
signed by the City and the Association. The Board of Directors of the Association shall have
full power and authority to modify this Agreement on behalf of the Association and the consent
of the members of the Association or the owners of condominiums is not required.



This Agreement shall be effective automatically on the date it is recorded in the
records of Sonoma County, California.

ASSOCIATION: SANTERO WAY HOMEOWNERS ASSOCIATION
a California non-profit mutual benefit corporation

)

By: :
Its Pregienit & €< fﬁﬁr%-(

CITY: CITY OF COTATI
a public body
By:
Its:
_15 12213.5



EXHIBIT A - Private Improvements

Private Improvements are located within the Private Ultility & Private Drainage & Private
Access Basements (“P.U.P.D.P.AE.”} areas and include:

Sidewalks

Arbor and mailboxes

Landscaping : A

Irrigation sy§tems, including controllers

All other private utilities and drainage features

e

FALJW-DATAWPDocs\Golvin\ColvCota.LicenseAgm. V2. wod Qctober 5, 2010



EXHIBIT B - Walkway Standard

All P.U.P.D.P.A.E. sidewalks shall be maintained in a smooth and 1evél condition of
sufficient width so that:

L The sidewalk does not have more than 1/4-inch abrupt change in elevation that can

create a tripping hazard; and

-2 The width of the sidewalk is compliant with the Americans with Disabilitie_s Act
(ADA) standards in effect at the time of the original construction or any subsequent reconstruction,
and the Association shall take reasonable measures to keep the sidewalks free of obstructions or

~ hazardous conditions. | : '

FALJW-DATAWPDocs\ColvimGotvCota.LicenseAgm.V2.wpd . . ‘ October 5, 2010



BEXHIBIT C



i
DESIGNATED REMAINDER ;
1.5 ACRES
NOTIGE: H
SEE SHEETS & FOR ALL LOCAL AGENCY mmcmummo sz.%mbﬁcz )
COLVIN GROUP FUND I, LF '
| BOOK 339 MAPS, PAGES 3838, S.C.R.
FARCEL 38 O PRVATE 250E5S
. BT EASEMENT —
S 2542'00" £ 3p4.08° . o /
e o
25 -
mo.oa.lm -
B 3%
P, R
s g
“Bols S
£ S§
Gyl L
- _ 08
' T e 30
PARGEL "A" R W ¢_a
PUBLIC PARK g5 1 Go
"~ &
45 W
Pl L e 5=
LuE R
L _W. _ﬂ &)
g FEQ
LR ) U
i= *
N 4
W =
- 8.0 -
=N
COMMON AREA PARCEL: TEW b [ o I
(THO CONDOMIHII UNITS} . S COMMoN AREA PARCEL NNE ruponac -
(THO CONDOMINIEN czzwv B | _
FE...# - .
. Yoo-Ly feer
[ P SR 002 50, L-zes, 5 3 A _
BT kX : ; i -
¥ - weouﬁsﬁxnsi Y EASDIDHT, I
Pkt _ = 3 . BOIT w.u,wl_ - c
. S RBME00T K 364,85 - T T
S B0 nonden IROTOATES Yee BOWY OF THE FARCEL OF LKiD BEINS SIBDIVIDSD. SEE SHEET 4 .
"ML DISTANCES ANO. DINEHSTONS ARE IH FERT AND DERTMALS THEREGF.
; . SANTERD WAY COTATI STATION PHASE 1
=m88ﬁ.=.m§§§§§E>Em§§o€m§m§aﬁsﬁg DATEY APRTL  LEQERD K A FOUNT BUBSDIVISION AND RESIDIENTIAL CONDCHMINIR ,
1, 2002 {CEDEN HO. ADGOT2-EO}. s " SDTVIZIIN OO CITY OF GROTAT, COUNTY OF BONCMA. STATE OF CALFORMA
. . AT OF COTATI ENGINEERING FLE PA NO, /02, %0 BNGLE-FAMLY
USLESS OTHERNISE GUOWN THE STARINGS K ALL RTERION LOT LIKEA -BHALL BE TAGEH A5 - © S Lf2 ION PIE, TAGED A3 Gkl FREGOENTIAL, LOTE, 10-COMMOI ARGA PARCELS WITH
HORTH 84*58°20% EAST OR NOATH 2E'42°04° WENT, BEING PARALLEL- OR PERPERDICRAR YO o FOUNC 3[4 IREH PIPE, ILLEDISLE THWEO CONDOMBIUM LTS PER COMMON AREA PARCEL
THE CENTERLIAR OF BARTERS WY, : o roxe nean, ko o // AND PARCELS 4, B, C; AND D 408 ACFEB AND
ALL PATVATE CHORQAHGENT AN MATHTENANCE CASCRENTS SHOWY ARE IH PAYOR OF, AND APPURTENANT. 16 THE DONFIOUDUS LOT @  Fow commLDE STRCET e = - DESKINATED REMANCER SEFTEMBER 2002
0f COHDOWINTtM UNIT COMMOH AREM, PARCEL. - LAYIHA WETHIZ RANGRD COTATY AND BEING A SUBDIVISION GF THE LAMDS OF
@ wﬂ%ﬁgg COLVIA GRONF FURD I, LF, DESCRIGED IR DOCIRIERT 40,4003, 022220
- COMGON PARGEL *B* 18 A PAIVATE UTILTTY, PAIVATE DAATRADE, ACOESS, UAIHTEMANGE ARG ENCAGALHNENT Ls soz7 8.5.R,, TOGETHER WITE A FOAYION OF PANCEL ONE AS (ESCHEBED IR
1 EASEMEHT I FAVOR OF AND APPURTENANT TO OOMMOH AREA PARCELS OHE THROUGH ETONT AMD LOTA 1 THROUGH 40, THELUSIVE. BT L2 IROH PIPE, TAWRED "G BAT' DOGIMENT H0,2050-117484, BEING ALGS A BE-SUBDIVISION OF PARDEL
VRPN coacn 4, A3 DEQIGHAYED AMD &HOWH OH GITY OF COTAYT PARCEL MAP KO. 76,
COMMOH PARDEL *G* 18 A PRIVATG UTILITY, PRIVATE AN = R «.. ¢ v oe AAEA RIRGTLEL FILE Yl BOOK $30.0F MAPD, AT PARES 30-39, O.G.R.
Emﬁn_:»‘s%za%xﬁmﬁasggm»uiﬁrasﬁm&a& HELUBIVE, - AEBREVIATIONS . 2 L] 2 0 L CARLENZOLI
o REGH DAY : - 3 ”
COMMD PARGEL, *D* 6 A PRIVATE UTILLTY, PRIVATE DRATHAUE, ACCESS, MATHTEMANGE AMD SMOSCAGRENT 265 BOCLGEHT MAGER ok . om0 fosl iww
i EASEENT EH FAVOR OF AKD APPURKERANT 10 COMIOH AREA PARGEL NINE'LDTS 41 Y0 45, ISGLESIVE. CE e iz . )
THE REAL PROPEATY WITHIN THE ZOUNIWAIES OF COVMMGH AREA PARCELS NS THROUGH YEH, THOLUSIVE COMPRIGE A REBTBENTSAL a.._._... il ASSOCIATES
CHNDOMIHEI AN 18 SUBJEST T0 THE PROVISIONS OF A COMDMINT FLAN WIOH WILL 5E RECORDED CONTEWPORKIEGUSLY WETH  EDrn p ac. TSTTATE VHLITY & SAIVATE OCROUGE & PRIVATE ACCESS EXGCIKT Civt Bnginsses ~ fand Sunxyers - Plonners
THE FILING OF THES AP, S8R oM LOXNTY RECIROS Sarda Roza Caltfornic
L3 B - BASIS OF BEARING: sp5v42°00" m wm_asmmz nmwxﬂﬂmzmmﬁw ﬂm.ﬁ%..:mu Sw,.mmcbumé
FHIVATE URATHAGE EASEVERTS ARE ALL TR FAVOR OF ASD APPURTENANT TO COMROR ANEA PARCSL OHF THAOUH FIGHT MM LOTE  PuE. PTG oToed il SAATERD RA o
% THROUGH 40, THGELBIVE , Mw”wm. T ASEAENT BOOK 335 OF WAPS, PAGE 27, SONOMA GUUNTY RECOADS.

JOB NO. 1874

APN t?&mc}ano X 144 ,.u»o 017 mxmﬂ 5 OF 6 SHEETS

Qo=



STATE OF CALIFO

A
COUNTY OF =0 Ve Mg

on_MARH 10, oy

—~ { _
beforeme, KQGZ R @ \/WL{ B2~ aNotaryPublic,

personally appeared '] Ve Ty \/J \;f ALYy

who proved to me on the basis of satisfactory evidence to be fhe person(s) whose name(® is/masubscribefi to the within
instounent and acknowledged to me that he/shelthey executed the same in his/berftheir authiorized capacity(ies) and by
his/herttheir signature(syon the instrument the person{s); or the cntzty upon bebalf of which the person(giacted; executed

the instrument.

I certify under PENALTY OF PER}'URY under the laws of the State of California that the foregoing paragraph is true

and correct.
| WITNESS my d officiat-seal.
Sigragaf, - P

B eER W O WMeana

Name-(typed or printed), Notary Public in
and for said County and State. C

STATE OF CALIFORNIA
COUNTY OF

Cn

__beforeme,

T TOEY. S ke

COMM. #1739313 &
NOTARY PUBLIC - CALFORNIA £
/ SOMOMA COLNTY arg

My Comm. Exps

> ROGERW. O MEAﬂ

personally appeared

aNotary Public, -

who proved to me on the basis of satisfactbry eﬁdence to be the person(s) whoss name(s) is/are silbscribe_d to the *mthm :
instrument and acknowledged to me that he/she/they executed the same in his/her/their authorized capacity(ies) and by
his/her/their signature(s) on the instrement the person(s), or the entity upon behalf of which the person(s) acted, executed

the msfmmem

I cemfy under PENALTY OF PERJURY under the laws of the State of Cahforma that the foregoing paragraph is true

. and correct.

WITNESS my hand and official seal.

Signature

Name (typed or printed), Notary Public in

and for said County and State,

{seal) -

’ F:\LJW—DATA\WPDocs\Ceivin\Co!vCuta.LicenseAgm.VE.wD_d

October 5, 2610



RESOLUTION NO. 06-02

- ARESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF COTATI
ACCEPTING THE PARK IMPROVEMENTS FOR SANTERO WAY PARK AND
ACCEPTING THE OFFER OF DEDICATION THEREOF

WHEREAS, The Colvin Group, LLC (TCG) did apply to the City for approval of
a subdivision map relating to APN 144-480-020 & 144-320-017 (the Project), and

WHEREAS, as part of said subdivision, TCG did offer for dedication upon the
face of the final map The Parcel identified as Parcel A - Public Park (the Park) as more
particularly described on the Final Map of Cotati Station Phase I, recorded in the office of
the Sonoma County Recorder at Book 654, Pages 44-49 (Map), and

WHEREAS, pursuant to the action of the City Council of the City of Cotats
(Council) the offer of dedication was conditionally accepted subject to the completion
and acceptance of certain improvements, and

WHEREAS, said improvements have been completed by TCG: and

WHEREAS, in addition to the completion of said improvements, TCG has
located within the Park Property certain private improvements for the beneﬁt of the
Project (the Private Improvements); and

WHEREAS, the City Council is willing to permit said Private Improvements to
remain 1n the Park until the City determines they should be removed. provided that the
Homeowner's Association for the Project enters into a license agreement with the City
which includes prov:smns for mamtenance of the Private Improvements. mdemunification
of the Clty and insurance for the license area.

NOW, THEREFORE. BE IT RESOLVED, that the City Council of the City of
Cotat accepts Parcel A — Public Park as identified on the Map and accepts the Park
Improvements as complete subject 1o the following conditions:

I thata license agreement be entered into between the City and the Homeowner's
Association for the Project (the HOA) which provides that the City may require
the Private Improvements be removed at the City’s election and which further
provides that the HOA shall maintain the Private Improvements and shall defend
and indemnify the City for any claims, actions or proceedings ansing out of the
use or occupancy of the license area and which further provides that the HOA
shall maintain liability insurance 1n a mimimum amount of 1 milhon dollars at all

-times during the term of the license naming the City as an additional msured and
covering the license area and the acts, errors and omussions of the HOA relating
thereto '



2 that said license agreement be recorded prior to the recordation of a copy of this
resolution accepting the Park :

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that upon the recordation of this resolution Parcel A -
Public Park as identificd on the Map and the improvements located thereon shall be
accepted by the City of Cotati and the City Clerk is hereby directed to record a certified
copy of this Resolution with the Sonoma County Recorder upon the satisfaction of the
conditions set forth above

ok kk ok

IT IS HEREBY CERTIFIED that the foregoing resolution was duly introduced and
legally adopted at a regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Cotati held on the

- 11th day of January, 20006, by the following vote, to wit

ORCHARD __ YES
FOX __YES
GILARDI  _ YES _
MINNIS _YES
"MOORE YES

-_APProved'. flllae [/ //TLOK-M

/ Mayor

Deputy City Cler



Item No. 4

City Council
Regular Calendar

Subject: Sidewalk and Vegetation Maintenance Program
Date: March 23, 2011

Written by: Damien O’Bid, City Engineer / Director of Public Works

Recommendation

It is recommended that the City Council receive and file the report on the sidewalk and
vegetation maintenance program.

Background

Sidewalks

The California Streets and Highways Code, Division 7, Chapter 22, Sections 5600-5630 describe
how the City can require repairs by adjacent property owners through the obligation of property
owners to the maintain sidewalks. Sidewalks are defined to include *“...a park or parking strip
maintained in the area between the property line and the street line and also includes curbing,
bulkheads, retaining walls or other works for the protection of any sidewalk or of any such park
or parking strip.” Specifically, this code requires that adjacent property owners ““...shall
maintain any sidewalk in such condition that the sidewalk will not endanger persons or property
and maintain it in a condition which will not interfere with the public convenience in the use of
those works or areas...”.

The City of Cotati Municipal Code (CMC), Chapter 11.06, Section 010 includes similar
provisions, but it also creates a duty to the public to repair the sidewalk. Key provisions bolded
as follows:

A. The owner of a parcel of real property which fronts on any portion of a sidewalk area
between the property line of the parcel and the street line, including a parking strip and
curb, is responsible for the repair and maintenance of the sidewalk area and shall pay
the cost and expense of repair and maintenance.

B. The owner of a parcel of real property is under a duty to members of the public to keep

the portion of any sidewalk area described in subsection A of this section in a safe
condition. If the owner makes an alteration to the sidewalk, the owner must use ordinary

Y:\DATA\GROUP\EVERYONE\CCREPORTS\2011\20110323\Sidewalk and Landscape Program UPDATED.sr.docx



City Council Staff Report
Street and Vegetation Maintenance Program
March 23, 2011

care in making the alteration and in keeping the altered portion of the sidewalk in a
reasonably safe condition.

C. The failure of an owner to fulfill the duties imposed by subsections A and B of this section
is negligence and the owner is liable to members of the public injured as a result of
that negligence.

D. If the owner of the parcel of real property is not the person in possession, then the
responsibilities and duties imposed by subsections A and B of this section are also
imposed on the person in possession of the property.

The Streets and Highways Code also describes the process of property owner notification to
correct the deficiency, generally gives property owners 2 weeks to commence repairs and
provides for the City to make repairs if the property owner is non-responsive. If the City makes
the repairs, there is a public hearing on the matter and then unless modified by the City Council,
the cost of the repairs is assessed as a lien on the property.

Vegetation Maintenance
In accordance with CMC, Chapter 11.10, Section 070, private property owners have the
following obligations, with the key provisions bolded:

A. It shall be the duty of any person having trees, shrubs, grass or other vegetation planted
in the public right-of-way adjacent to his or her property, to water and generally
maintain such trees, shrubs, grass and vegetation. It shall also be the duty of any person
having trees, shrubs, grass or other vegetation planted in the public right-of-way
adjacent to his or her property, or planted on his or her private property, to repair any
damage to the public right-of-way or other city property caused by the trees, shrubs,
grass or vegetation.

The procedure for notifying, and if non-responsive, requiring property owners to maintain
vegetation in a safe state is found in the nuisance abatement section (Chapter 9.100) of the CMC.
The nuisance abatement process requires notification of the property owners to correct the
nuisance, and if non-responsive, hold a public hearing on the matter. If the City Council
determines the nuisance must be abated and the property owner continues to be non-responsive,
then the City will abate the nuisance. In this case, the cost of the repairs is assessed as a lien on
the property.

Analysis/Discussion

In general, most sidewalk damage is due to uplift caused by adjacent trees. However, the Streets
and Highways Code, and the CMC are clear and unqualified that the adjacent property owner is
responsible for maintenance, regardless of the cause. The only exception in the Streets and
Highways Code is ““...to those condition created or maintained in, upon, along, or in connection
with such sidewalk by any person other than the owner, under and by virtue of any permit or
right granted to him by law or by the city authorities in charge thereof, and such persons shall

Page 2 of 3



City Council Staff Report
Street and Vegetation Maintenance Program
March 23, 2011

be under a like duty in relation thereto.” This is intended to require third parties doing work in
the public right of way (franchise utilities or parties under encroachment permits) to repair
damage they created and creates this obligation for repair.

In order to remove unnecessary barriers to property owners, the City recently adopted a change
to the encroachment permit ordinance so that these property owners can take out a “no-cost”
encroachment permit for repairs in the public right of way. Nevertheless, depending on the
extent of sidewalk damage and the potential need to hire an arborist to evaluate the tree root
system, sidewalk repairs can still cost up to $2,000-$3,000.

In a recent survey of nearby cities, the implementation of the sidewalk repair program was found
to be inconsistent. In most cases, the cities follow the Streets and Highways Code, and typically
also have a local ordinance to create a duty to repair for the public.

With vegetation maintenance, in accordance with the CMC sections cited previously, property

owners are responsible for vegetation maintenance in the public right of way and damage to the
public right of way caused by vegetation on private property. These cases are handled through
the nuisance abatement process.

Financial Considerations

A formal sidewalk repair and vegetation management program is time consuming, and can
require significant city staff time. However, this may be considered in the upcoming strategic
planning workshops.

Environmental Issues

None.

Page 3 of 3






Item No. 5
City Council
Regular Agenda

Subject: Request to Renew an Annual License For a Medical Marijuana Dispensary
License at 7950 Redwood Drive, Suite 8 (APN: 144-060-006)

Date: March 23, 2011

Written By:  Marsha Sue Lustig, Assistant to the City Manager/Acting Community
Development Director

RECOMMENDATION:

Adoption of a resolution approving a request to renew an annual license for Mercy Wellness, an
existing Medical Marijuana Dispensary located at 7950 Redwood Drive,
Suite 8.

Background

On August 22, 2007, the City Council adopted Ordinance No. 787, providing regulations to allow
one medical marijuana dispensary (MMD) within the City of Cotati. According to the Ordinance,
the City Council is the review authority responsible for approving or denying medical marijuana
license applications.

On March 10, 2010, the City Council granted a license for a medical marijuana dispensary, now
known as Mercy Wellness of Cotati, at 7950 Redwood Drive, Suite 8. The applicant submitted a
timely renewal application and application fee, as well as, the required $30,000 Public Services
Fee.

Analysis/Discussion:

Mercy Wellness of Cotati has been in official operation since August, 2010. The Chief of Police
and Acting Community Development Director visited the dispensary recently to review
compliance with Ordinance 787. Staff found the dispensary to be fastidious and nearly odor-free.
A security guard was stationed inside the facility. The dispensary operation seems most
comparable to a jewelry store.

The Cotati Police Department and the Rancho Adobe Fire District have been contacted and both
organizations are satisfied that there are no outstanding safety issues. Included in the application
submittal are several letters of support from current and past tenants of the shopping center. There
have been no complaints received by the City.

Condition No. 2 limited the hours of operations with a caveat that pending resolution of potential
conflicts with the Calvary Life Church, the Community Development Director may revise the
hours to match those allowed by Ordinance 787. In January, as Church membership was reduced
and they were preparing to vacate the site, staff increased the hours for the dispensary. It is
recommended that Condition No. 2 be modified to reflect the hours allowed by Ordinance 787.



City Council

Mercy Medical Marijuana Dispensary
License Renewel

March 23, 2011

Public Services Fee

At the time of the 2010 City Council license approval the owners of Mercy Wellness agreed to
Condition No. 6:

It is agreed and understood that a cannabis business will have a municipal impact requiring
additional oversight by Police and Public Works Department. It is therefore necessary to offset
these costs and impose an annual Public Services Fee in the amount of $30,000.00 or 1.8% of
sales, whichever is greater. The City of Cotati may adjust the fee annually with each reapplication,
expansion of the license, or, if it is determined that the impact is greater. This Public Services Fee
shall be reported and paid to the City of Cotati annually prior to the reapplication hearing, except
for the first year when the fee is due on or before June 10, 2010. License holder acknowledges that
they have voluntarily agreed to pay Public Services Fee. License holder makes this offer for the
lifetime that they operate a MMD within the City of Cotati.

The applicant, Greg Lucas, has deposited a check with the City as required by Condition No. 6
above. However, he is requesting a change to the condition such that he is allowed to make
quarterly payments of $7,500 due March 10", June 10", September 10" and December 10" of
each year. He would like to begin this payment system retroactive to his March 10 payment. Staff
supports this request because it will reduce the financial burden for this new business during the
recession. Condition No. 6 has been modified to reflect this request. Mr. Lucas plans to return in
the near future with a request for Council consideration for modifications to several provisions of
the Ordinance based upon his experience this past year. Staff agrees that there are some
modifications that may help this business succeed now that the City has had the opportunity to
see the business operate.

Financial Considerations:

There are no additional costs to the City at this time. The applicant pays an annual $30,000 public
services fee or 1.8% of gross sales receipts, whichever is greater.

Conclusion

The purpose of the annual license renewal is to assure that potential impacts are avoided. The
applicant has paid close attention to the requirements of Ordinance No. 787 and has designed the
MMD to satisfy the requirements and concerns of the City of Cotati. Mr. Lucas understands that
the license must be renewed annually.

Attachments:

1. Proposed resolution
2. March 10, 2010 City Council Minutes
3. March 14, 2011 Letter from Greg Lucas



RESOLUTION NO. 2011-

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF COTATI
APPROVING THE RENEWAL OF A MEDICAL MARIJUANA
DISPENSARY LICENSE AT 7950 REDWOOD DRIVE, SUITE 8.

APN 144-060-006 — PA# 30/09 — Lucas/Mercy Wellness of Cotati

WHEREAS, on August 22, 2007, the City Council adopted Ordinance No. 787, which allows
up to one medical marijuana dispensary to be approved by the City Council through a license
application process; and

WHEREAS, on November 17, 2009, an application for a medical marijuana dispensary license
at 7950 Redwood Drive, Suite 8 was received by the City of Cotati; and

WHEREAS, on March 9, 2010, the City Council adopted Resolution 2010-06 approving a
one-year license for a dispensary at 7950 Redwood Drive; and

WHEREAS, as required by Ordinance No. 787, Mr. Greg Lucas, owner of Mercy Wellness
Medical Marijuana Dispensary, has applied to renew this license for the next year; and

WHEREAS, the applicant has submitted all requested information; and

WHEREAS, on March 23, 2011, the City Council held a duly noticed public hearing to
consider public testimony and all relevant materials including the City Council staff report and
all correspondence and related documentation regarding the request to renew the medical
marijuana dispensary license at 7950 Redwood Drive, Suite 8, for a period of one year; and

WHEREAS, the City Council found the renewal application to be consistent with Ordinance
No. 787; and

WHEREAS, the applicant has voluntarily agreed to pay an annual Public Services Fee, fee to
be determined by the City Council annually, which is intended to encourage the applicants to
report police calls and maintain contact with the City of Cotati Police Department; and

WHEREAS, the proposed project has been reviewed for consistency and found to be
consistent with the intent of the City of Cotati General Plan and Municipal Code; and

WHEREAS, the City Council further finds that the health, safety, and welfare of the citizens
of the City of Cotati will not be jeopardized by the approval of this project; and

WHEREAS, the Record of Proceedings (“Record”) upon which the City Council based its
decision regarding the Project includes, but is not limited to: (1) all staff reports, minutes, City
files and records and other documents prepared for and/or submitted to and/or approved by the
Planning Commission, the City Council and the City relating to the project, (2) the City of
Cotati General Plan, its related EIR and the Cotati Municipal Code, (3) all applications,
designs, plans, studies, data and correspondence submitted by the Applicant in connection with
the Project, (4) all documentary and oral evidence received at public hearings or submitted to



the City relating to the Project, (5) prior CEQA documents prepared for previously proposed
projects in the vicinity of the project site, and (6) all other matters of common knowledge to the
City Council, and the City, including, but not limited to, City, state and federal laws, policies,
rules, regulations, reports, records and projections related to development within the City and
its surrounding areas; and

WHEREAS, the City of Cotati City Manager’s Office is the location and custodian of the
documents which constitute the record of proceeding, upon which the Council’s decision herein

is based.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF COTATI FINDS AS
FOLLOWS:

1. That the above recitals are true and correct and constitute a part of the findings made by
the City Council in approving this Resolution.

2. The approval is subject to the following findings of fact:

a.

That the proposed dispensary operation is consistent with the intent of Proposition
215 and related state law, the provisions of this chapter and the city code, including
the application submittal and operating requirements herein;

That the dispensary location is not identified as having significant crime issues (e.g.,
based upon crime reporting district/statistics as maintained by the police
department);

That an applicant or employee is not under eighteen years of age;

That all required application materials have been provided and/or the dispensary has
operated successfully in a manner that shows it will comply with the operating
requirements and standards specified in this chapter;

That all required application or annual renewal fees have been paid and reporting
requirements have been satisfied in a timely manner;

That an appropriate limit on size of the dispensary has been established and the
requested license would not exceed limitations on number of patients and/or
licenses allowed by this chapter;

That issuance of a dispensary license for the size requested is justified to meet the
needs of residents;

That issuance of the dispensary license would serve the needs of residents at this
location;

That the location is not prohibited by the provisions of this chapter or any local or
state law, statute, rule or regulation and no significant nuisance issues or problems
are anticipated or resulted;
That the site plan, floor plan, and security plan have incorporated features necessary
to assist in reducing potential crime-related problems and as specified in the
operating requirements of this chapter. These features may include, but are not
limited to, security on-site; procedure for allowing entry; openness to surveillance
and control of the premises, the perimeter, and surrounding properties; reduction of
opportunities for congregating and obstructing public ways and neighboring

Resolution No.
Page 2 of 6



property; illumination of exterior areas; and limiting furnishings and features that
encourage loitering and nuisance behavior;

That no dispensary owner, licensee, agent, or employee affiliated with the applicant
has violated any provision of this chapter including grounds for suspension,
modification or revocation of a license;

I. That all reasonable measures have been incorporated into the plan and consistently

taken to successfully control the establishment's patrons' conduct resulting in
disturbances, vandalism, uncontrolled crowds in or outside the dispensary, traffic
control problems, ingesting cannabis in public, or creation of a public or private
nuisance, or interference of the operation of another business;

That the dispensary would not adversely affect the health, peace or safety of
persons living or working in the surrounding area, overly burden a specific
neighborhood with special needs or high impact uses, or contribute to a public
nuisance; or that the dispensary has resulted in repeated nuisance activities
including disturbances of the peace, illegal drug activity, ingesting cannabis in
public, harassment of passerby, excessive littering, excessive loitering, illegal
parking, excessive loud noises, especially late at night or early in the morning hours,
lewd conduct, or police detentions or arrests;

That the applicant has not violated any local or state law, statute, rule or regulation
respecting the distribution, possession, or consumption of cannabis;

That the applicant has not knowingly made a false statement of material fact or has
knowingly omitted to state a material fact in the application for a license;

That the applicant, his or her agent or employees, or any person who is exercising
managerial authority on behalf of the applicant has not been convicted of a felony,
or of a misdemeanor involving moral turpitude, or has engaged in misconduct
related to the qualifications, functions or duties of a licensee. A conviction within
the meaning of this section means a plea or verdict of guilty or a conviction
following a plea of nolo contendere;

That the applicant has not engaged in unlawful, fraudulent, unfair, or deceptive
business acts or practices.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Cotati that the
license renewal application for Mercy Wellness of Cotati, a medical marijuana dispensary,
located at 7950 Redwood Drive, Suite 8, is hereby approved based upon the foregoing findings
and subject to the Conditions of Approval, attached as Exhibit “A.”

skokoskoskoskoskosk

Resolution No.
Page 3 of 6



IT ISHEREBY CERTIFIED that the foregoing resolution was duly introduced and legally
adopted at a regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Cotati held on the 23™ day of
March, 2011 by the following vote, to wit:

ORCHARD
COLEMAN-SENGHOR
GILARDI

HARVEY

LANDMAN

Approved:
Janet Orchard, Mayor

Attest:

Tamara Taylor, Deputy City Clerk

Approved as to form:

Rich Rudnansky, City Attorney

Resolution No.
Page 4 of 6



10.

Exhibit “A”
Conditions of Approval — Mercy Medical Dispensary
7950 Redwood Drive, Suite 8

This Medical Marijuana Dispensary (MMD) license application is granted for a 1,136 square foot
MMD located at 7950 Redwood Drive, Suite 8. The applicant shall comply with Ordinance No.
787 at all times.

Hours of Operation shallnet-exceed-the-folowing:

o Sundays:————pm—Spm
o Saturday————0am—7pm

losed i Council - od fostival weekend
o (Closed-on{state-observed)-Legal Holidays

Ne—F8%-are as proscribed by Ordinance No. 787.

Lighting, security, and signage programs require review and approval from the Chief of Police and
Community Development Director, and shall be operational prior to occupancy.

Security uniforms shall be reviewed and approved by the City of Cotati Chief of Police.

Applicant and employees shall pass a criminal history background check prior to issuance of the
License. All employees at all times shall conform to the background check process to the
satisfaction of the Chief of Police.

It is agreed and understood that a cannabis business will have a municipal impact requiring
additional oversight by Police and Public Works Department. It is therefore necessary to offset these
costs and impose an annual Public Services Fee in the amount of $30,000.00 or 1.8% of sales,
whichever is greater. The City of Cotati may adjust the fee annually with each reapplication,
expansion of the license, or, if it is determined that the impact is greater. This Public Services Fee
shall be reported and paid to the City of Cotati annually prior to the reapplication hearing, exeept-for
the-first-year when-the fee-is-due-on-or-before June 10,2010. For year No. 2, from March 10, 2011
through March 10, 2012, 5 payments of $7500 each shall be made to the City including the payment
required prior to consideration of Year 3 License Renewal. To maintain the license for this year all
payments shall be received no later than March 10, 2011, June 10, 2011, September 10, 2011,
December 10, 2011 and March 10, 2012. License holder acknowledges that they have voluntarily
agreed to pay Public Services Fee. License holder makes this offer for the lifetime that they operate
a MMD within the City of Cotati.

All uses at 7950 Redwood Drive shall possess all required permits and licenses. Failure of the
property owners to ensure that all businesses have a business license and all other required permits
shall be cause for termination of the Mercy MMD license. This is to ensure that the City is aware of
compatibility of land uses and parking allocations.

Seven parking spaces shall remain free and clear and available for Mercy MMD during business
hours.

The applicant shall be responsible for denying recommendations that are from physicians that they
should reasonably know are not following the letter of Proposition 215.

The License Holder is required to be in conformance with City of Cotati Ordinance No. 787 at all
times, as determined by the City of Cotati Community Development Director. Failure to be in
conformance with Ordinance No. 787 shall be grounds for revocation of the License.

Resolution No.
Page 5 of 6



